Dear Senators COOK, Lenney, Ward-Engelking, and
Representatives CLOW, Ehlers, Berch:

The Legislative Services Office, Research and Legislation, has received the enclosed rules of the

Division of Occupational and Professional Licenses - tdahe Eleetrical Board Building Safety:

IDAPA 24.39.30 - Rules of Building Safety (Building Code Rules) (ZBR Chapter Rewrite, Fee Rule)
- Proposed Rule (Docket No. 24-3930-2302);

IDAPA 24.39.31 - Rules for Factory Built Structures (ZBR Chapter Rewrite, Fee Rule) - Proposed
Rule (Docket No. 24-3931-2301);

IDAPA 24.39.50 - Rules of the Public Works Contractors License Board (ZBR Chapter Rewrite, Fee
Rule) - Proposed Rule (Docket No. 24-3950-2301).

Pursuant to Section 67-454, Idaho Code, a meeting on the enclosed rules may be called by the
cochairmen or by two (2) or more members of the subcommittee giving oral or written notice to Research
and Legislation no later than fourteen (14) days after receipt of the rules' analysis from Legislative
Services. The final date to call a meeting on the enclosed rules is no later than 10/06/2023. If a meeting is
called, the subcommittee must hold the meeting within forty-two (42) days of receipt of the rules' analysis
from Legislative Services. The final date to hold a meeting on the enclosed rules is 11/03/2023.

The germane joint subcommittee may request a statement of economic impact with respect to a
proposed rule by notifying Research and Legislation. There is no time limit on requesting this statement,
and it may be requested whether or not a meeting on the proposed rule is called or after a meeting has
been held.

To notify Research and Legislation, call 334-4854, or send a written request to the address on the

memorandum attached below.

Page 1 of 1



Legislative Services Office
Idaho State Legislature

Terri Kondeff Serving Idaho's Citizen Legislature
Director
MEMORANDUM
TO: Rules Review Subcommittee of the Senate Commerce & Human Resources Committee and the

House Business Committee

FROM: Principal Legislative Drafting Attorney - Ryan Bush
DATE: September 19, 2023
SUBJECT: Division of Occupational and Professional Licenses - Idaho Eleetrical Beard Building Safety

IDAPA 24.39.30 - Rules of Building Safety (Building Code Rules) (ZBR Chapter Rewrite, Fee Rule) -
Proposed Rule (Docket No. 24-3930-2302)

IDAPA 24.39.31 - Rules for Factory Built Structures (ZBR Chapter Rewrite, Fee Rule) - Proposed Rule
(Docket No. 24-3931-2301)

IDAPA 24.39.50 - Rules of the Public Works Contractors License Board (ZBR Chapter Rewrite, Fee Rule)
- Proposed Rule (Docket No. 24-3950-2301)

Docket No. 24-3930-2302

Summary and Stated Reasons for the Rule

The Division of Occupational and Professional Licenses submits notice of proposed rulemaking via
IDAPA 24.39.30 - Rules of Building Safety (Building Code Rules) (ZBR Chapter Rewrite, Fee Rule). As
part of the Governor's Zero-Based Regulation executive order, the Division states that it collaborated with the
public to streamline and simplify the rule language, to use plain language, and to provide updates to comply
with governing statute. The Division further states that no fees are being changed as a result of this rulemaking.

Negotiated Rulemaking / Fiscal Impact

The Division states that negotiated rulemaking was conducted and that notice was published in the June
edition of the Idaho Administrative Bulletin. There is no anticipated fiscal impact associated with this rule-
making.

Statutory Authority

The proposed rule appears to be within the statutory authority granted to the Division in Sections 33-356,
29-4107, 39-4109, 39-4112, 39-4113, 39-9701 and 67-2604, Idaho Code.

Docket No. 24-3931-2301

Summary and Stated Reasons for the Rule

Paul Headlee, Deputy Director Kristin Ford, Manager = Keith Bybee, Manager April Renfro, Manager Norma Clark, Manager
Legislative Services Office Research & Legislation Budget & Policy Analysis  Legislative Audits Information Technology

Statehouse, P.O. Box 83720 Tel: 208-334-2475
Boise, Idaho 83720-0054 legislature.idaho.gov




The Division of Occupational and Professional Licenses submits notice of proposed rulemaking via
IDAPA 24.39.31 - Rules for Factory Built Structures (ZBR Chapter Rewrite, Fee Rule). As part of the
Governor's Zero-Based Regulation executive order, the Division states that it collaborated with the public
to streamline and simplify the rule language, to use plain language, and to provide updates to comply with
governing statute. The Division further states that no fees are being changed as a result of this rulemaking.

Negotiated Rulemaking / Fiscal Impact

The Division states that negotiated rulemaking was conducted and that notice was published in the June
edition of the Idaho Administrative Bulletin. There is no anticipated fiscal impact associated with this rule-
making.

Statutory Authority

The proposed rule appears to be within the statutory authority granted to the Division in Sections 39-4003,
39-4302, 44-2102, 44-2104, 44-2201, and 67-2604, Idaho Code.

Docket No. 24-3950-2301

Summary and Stated Reasons for the Rule

The Division of Occupational and Professional Licenses submits notice of proposed rulemaking via
IDAPA 24.39.50 - Rules of the Public Works Contractors License Board (ZBR Chapter Rewrite, Fee Rule). As
part of the Governor's Zero-Based Regulation executive order, the Division states that it collaborated with the
public to streamline and simplify the rule language, to use plain language, and to provide updates to comply
with governing statute. The Division further states that no fees are being changed as a result of this rulemaking.

Negotiated Rulemaking / Fiscal Impact

The Division states that negotiated rulemaking was conducted and that notice was published in the June
edition of the Idaho Administrative Bulletin. There is no anticipated fiscal impact associated with this rule-
making.

Statutory Authority

The proposed rule appears to be within the statutory authority granted to the Division in Sections 54-1907
and 67-2604, Idaho Code.

cc: Division of Occupational and Professional Licenses - Idahe Eleetrical BeardBuilding Safety
Katie Stuart

**%* PLEASE NOTE ***
Per the Idaho Constitution, all administrative rules may be reviewed by the Legislature during the next legisla-
tive session. The Legislature has 3 options with this rulemaking docket: 1) Approve the docket in its entirety;
2) Reject the docket in its entirety; or 3) Reject the docket in part.

Page 2 of 2



IDAPA 24 — DIVISION OF OCCUPATIONAL AND PROFESSIONAL LICENSES
24.39.30 - RULES OF BUILDING SAFETY (BUILDING CODE RULES
DOCKET NO. 24-3930-2302 (ZBR CHAPTER REWRITE, FEE RULE)
NOTICE OF RULEMAKING - PROPOSED RULE

AUTHORITY: In compliance with Section 67-5221(1), Idaho Code, notice is hereby given that this agency has
initiated proposed rulemaking procedures. This rulemaking action is authorized pursuant to Section 67-2604, Idaho
Code, and Sections 33-356, 39-4107, 39-4109, 39-4112, 39-4113, 39-9701, 67-2614, 67-9406, and 67-9409, Idaho
Code.

PUBLIC HEARING SCHEDULE: Two public hearings concerning this rulemaking will be held as follows:

Thursday, September 7, 2023, 9:00 a.m. MT
&
Tuesday, November 7, 2023, 9:00 a.m. MT

Division of Occupational and Professional Licenses
Chinden Campus Building 4
11341 W. Chinden Blvd., Bldg. #4
Boise, ID 83714

Telephone and web conferencing information will be posted on:
https://dopl.idaho.gov/calendar/ and https://townhall.idaho.gov/

The hearing site will be accessible to persons with disabilities, if needed. Requests for accommodation must be
made not later than five (5) days prior to the meeting to the agency address below.

DESCRIPTIVE SUMMARY AND STATEMENT OF PURPOSE: The following is a nontechnical explanation of
the substance and purpose of the proposed rulemaking:

Under Executive Order 2020-01, Zero-Based Regulation, the Building Code Board is striving to prevent the
accumulation of costly, ineffective, and outdated regulations and reduce regulatory burden to achieve a more efficient
operation of government. In conjunction with stakeholders, the proposed rule changes reflect a comprehensive review
of this chapter by collaborating with the public to streamline or simplify the rule language in this chapter and to use
plain language for better understanding. This proposed rulemaking updates the rules to comply with governing statute
and Executive Order 2020-01.

FEE SUMMARY: The following is a specific description of the fee or charge imposed or increased:
The fees for applications, licenses, and reinstatement as designated in Rule 400 of these proposed rules are
authorized in Section 39-4017, Idaho Code. None of these fees are being changed as a result of this rulemaking or

since being previously reviewed by the Idaho legislature.

FISCAL IMPACT: The following is a specific description, if applicable, of any negative fiscal impact on the state
general fund greater than ten thousand dollars ($10,000) during the fiscal year as a result of this rulemaking:

This rulemaking is not anticipated to have any negative fiscal impact on the State General Fund.
NEGOTIATED RULEMAKING: Pursuant to Section 67-5220, Idaho Code, negotiated rulemaking was conducted

under Docket No. 24-ZBRR-2301. The (Second) Omnibus Notice of Intent to Promulgate Rules - Negotiated
Rulemaking was published in the June 7, 2023 Idaho Administrative Bulletin, Vol. 23-6, pp. 75-76.

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 403 September 6, 2023 — Vol. 23-9


https://gov.idaho.gov/wp-content/uploads/2020/01/eo-2020-01.pdf
https://adminrules.idaho.gov/bulletin/2023/06.pdf#page=75
https://dopl.idaho.gov/calendar/
https://townhall.idaho.gov/

DIVISION OF OCCUPATIONAL& PROFESSIONAL LICENSES Docket No. 24-3930-2302
Rules of Building Safety (Building Code Rules) ZBR Proposed (Fee) Rule

INCORPORATION BY REFERENCE: Pursuant to Section 67-5229(2)(a), Idaho Code, the following is a brief
synopsis of why the materials cited are being incorporated by reference into this rule:

* International Building Code. The 2018 Edition, and 2021 Edition Relating to Mass Timber.

e International Residential Code. Parts I, II, III, and IX of the 2018 Edition for one (1)- and two (2)- family
dwellings.

* International Existing Building Code. 2018 Edition.

e International Energy Conservation Code — Commercial Provisions. The 2018 Edition.

* International Energy Conservation Code — Residential Provisions. The 2018 Edition.

The materials cited are incorporated by reference because they would be unduly cumbersome, expensive, or
otherwise inexpedient to republish all or in part. The materials cited are codes, standards, or rules adopted by a
nationally recognized organization or association.

ASSISTANCE ON TECHNICAL QUESTIONS, SUBMISSION OF WRITTEN COMMENTS, OBTAINING
DRAFT COPIES: For assistance on technical questions concerning this proposed rule, contact Katie Stuart, Bureau
Chief, at (208) 577-2489. Materials pertaining to the proposed rulemaking, including any available preliminary rule
drafts, can be found on the following DOPL website: https://dopl.idaho.gov/rulemaking/.

Anyone may submit written comments regarding this proposed rulemaking. All written comments must be
directed to the undersigned and must be delivered on or before November 7, 2023.

DATED this 4th day of August, 2023.

Katie Stuart

Bureau Chief

11341 W. Chinden Blvd., Bldg. #4
Boise, ID 83714

Phone: (208) 577-2489

Email: katie.stuart@dopl.idaho.gov

THE FOLLOWING IS THE PROPOSED TEXT OF FEE DOCKET NO. 24-3930-2302
(ZBR Chapter Rewrite)

*Note — Due to extensive reorganization of this ZBR chapter, the rule text below is presented as clean text without showing
amendments in legislative format. A redline copy provided by the agency has been included at the end of the docket for transparency
and can be utilized to track all edits used to formulate the proposed rule.

24.39.30 — RULES OF BUILDING SAFETY (BUILDING CODE RULES)

000. LEGAL AUTHORITY.
The rules are promulgated pursuant to Sections 33-356, 39-4107, 39-4109, 39-4112, 39-4113, 39-9701, Idaho Code.

C )

001. SCOPE.

The rules prescribe the criteria for enforcement and administration of the Idaho Building Code Act by the Idaho
Building Code Board and the Division of Occupational and Professional Licenses and the integrated design and
fundamental commissioning of public school facilities. ( )

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 404 September 6, 2023 — Vol. 23-9


https://dopl.idaho.gov/rulemaking/
mailto: katie.stuart@dopl.idaho.gov

DIVISION OF OCCUPATIONAL& PROFESSIONAL LICENSES Docket No. 24-3930-2302
Rules of Building Safety (Building Code Rules) ZBR Proposed (Fee) Rule

002. DEFINITIONS.

01. Listing Agency. A person, firm, association, partnership or corporation which is in the business of
listing or labeling and which maintains a periodic inspection program on current production of listed materials, and
which makes available, not less frequently than annually, a published report of such listing in which specific
information is included that the product has been tested to nationally approved standards and found safe for use in a

specified manner. ( )
02. Minor Alteration. The following definition is used for the purpose of administering annual
permits. ( )
a. Minor alterations shall include, but are not limited to, the following: partition walls constructed

within a defined room; relocation of or existing openings or installation of new doors and windows in non-load
bearing walls and not in construction meant to compartmentalize fire; window replacement in unaltered existing
openings; roof repairs involving installation of less than one hundred (100) square feet of new roof covering; and new
suspended ceilings that are not part of a required fire resistive assembly. ( )

b. Minor alterations shall not include: work that alters the fire resistive characteristics of the building
or fire suppression systems; work that creates new openings in construction meant to compartmentalize fire such as
fire walls, fire barriers, fore partitions, smoke barriers, smoke partitions, horizontal assemblies, shaft enclosures, stair
enclosures; work that increases the floor area or height of the building; work that changes the structural load path of
the building for gravity or horizontal loads; work that reduces the thermal resistant capacity of the building envelop;
changes in the occupancy classification of the building or space; increases in the floor loads. ( )

003. - 199. (RESERVED)

200. INTEGRATED DESIGN AND FUNDAMENTAL COMMISSIONING OF PUBLIC SCHOOL
FACILITIES.

01. Technical and Educational Information. Technical and educational information related to
integrated design and fundamental commissioning in the form of the American Institute of Architects Integrated
Project Delivery Guide; Portland Energy Conservation, Inc. (PECI) Commissioning Guides; ASHRAE Guideline 0-
2005-The Commissioning Process; and the Northwest Energy Efficiency Alliance Integrated Design Special Focus
on Energy Performance Guide is available on the Division’s. A building commissioned under the prescriptive
approaches defined by any of the above-named national organizations is deemed to have completed the Fundamental
Commissioning process. ( )

02. Commissioning Agents. The Division has compiled and made available for public examination a
list of all known third party building commissioning agents in Idaho and its contiguous states. The Division has
ensured that all such commissioning agents appearing on this list have been certified by the Building Commissioning

Association (BCA) or other similar certifying entity. ( )
03. Annual Optimization Review. ( )
a. The third-party commissioning agent who performed the initial fundamental commissioning for a

public school building must provide the school district with a written report identifying the systems which will be
subject to the Idaho Code Section 33-356 annual optimization review and identifying the system requirements and/or

other relevant measuring criteria. The written report shall, at a minimum include the following: ( )
1. Verification that the heating, ventilation, and air conditioning (HVAC) systems, controls, dampers,
valves, sensors and other equipment used to control the system are functioning as they were at the commissioning of
the bulldlng, ( )
ii. Verification that the lighting controls are functioning as they were at the commissioning of the
building; and «C )

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 405 September 6, 2023 — Vol. 23-9



DIVISION OF OCCUPATIONAL& PROFESSIONAL LICENSES Docket No. 24-3930-2302
Rules of Building Safety (Building Code Rules) ZBR Proposed (Fee) Rule

1il. The requirement that any changes made to any of the controls contained on the agent’s list after the
initial commissioning be re-set back to the commissioned settings unless it can be demonstrated that the new settings
result in greater energy efficiency. ( )

b. The annual optimization review shall be performed by persons qualified to make the required
determinations and adjustments. ( )

c. Following the annual optimization review, the school district shall submit to the Division written
verification indicating (1) the systems identified by the commissioning agent, including those identified in this
Section are functioning as they were at the initial commissioning; and (2) identifying the persons performing the
optimization and their qualifications. ( )

04. Commissioning Anniversary Date. The date upon which the commissioning agent provides the
school district with the required written report described in Paragraph 038.04.b. of these rules shall be the
commissioning anniversary date for purposes of this Section. If a school district seeks to qualify a building for the
building replacement value calculation, the annual optimization review shall be performed within thirty (30) days of
the annual commissioning anniversary date following the first year the building is in operation. The written
verification required by Paragraph 038.03.e. of these rules is due to the Division not later than sixty (60) days after
the annual commissioning anniversary date. ( )

05. Fundamental Building Commissioning Requirements. ( )

a. School districts seeking to qualify a building for the building replacement value calculation shall
engage a building commissioning agent. ( )

b. The commissioning agent must document the owner’s requirements for each commissioned system
in the facility. All HVAC and controls systems, duct work and piping, renewable and alternative technologies,
lighting controls and day lighting, waste heat recovery, and any other advanced technologies incorporated in the
building must be commissioned. Building envelope systems must also be verified. The owner’s requirements for
these systems may include efficiency targets and other performance criteria such as temperature and lighting levels
that will define the performance criteria for the functional performance testing that occurs prior to acceptance.

C )

c. The commissioning agent shall include commissioning requirements in the project construction
documents. This includes the scope of commissioning for the project, the systems to be commissioned, and the
various requirements related to schedule, submittal reviews, testing, training, O & M manuals, and warranty reviews.

C )

d. The commissioning agent shall develop and utilize a commissioning plan. This plan must include
an overview of the commissioning process for the project, a list of commissioned systems, primary commissioning
participants and their roles, a communication and management plan, an outline of the scope of commissioning tasks,

a list of work products, a schedule, and a description of any commissioning testing activities. ( )
e. The commissioning agent must submit a report to the owner once the commissioning plan has been
executed. ( )

201. -- 499. (RESERVED)
500. PERMITS AND PLAN REVIEW.

01. Annual Permit. In lieu of an individual permit for each minor alteration to an already approved
building, the Division may issue an annual permit upon application therefor to any state agency or state governmental
organization regularly employing one (1) or more qualified trade persons in the building, structure or on the premises
or campus owned or operated by the applicant for the permit. The agency to whom an annual permit is issued shall
keep a detailed record of alterations made under such annual permit. The Division shall be allowed access to such
records upon request or such records shall be filed with the Division as designated. The permit holder shall request
inspections and make the work accessible for inspection as required by the adopted codes and herein. ( )

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 406 September 6, 2023 — Vol. 23-9



DIVISION OF OCCUPATIONAL& PROFESSIONAL LICENSES Docket No. 24-3930-2302

Rules of Building Safety (Building Code Rules) ZBR Proposed (Fee) Rule
02. Plans Not Required. Plans are not required for group U occupancies of Type V conventional light-
frame wood construction. ( )
03. Fees. ( )
a. Technical Service Fee. One hundred dollars ($100) per hour. ( )
b. Building Permit Fees. The determination of value or valuation will be made by the administrator

and includes the total value of all construction work for which a permit is issued.

TABLE 1-A - BUILDING PERMIT FEES

Total Valuation Fee

$1 to $500 $23.50

$23.50 for the first $500 plus $3.05 for each additional $100, or
fraction thereof, to and including $2,000

$69.25 for the first $2,000 plus $14 for each additional $1,000, or
fraction thereof, to and including $25,000

$391.75 for the first $25,000 plus $10.10 for each additional
$1,000, or fraction thereof, to and including $50,000

$643.75 for the first $50,000 plus $7 for each additional $1,000,
or fraction thereof, to and including $100,000

$993.75 for the first $100,000 plus $5.60 for each additional
$1,000, or fraction thereof, to and including $500,000

$3,233.75 for the first $500,000 plus $4.75 for each additional
$1,000, or fraction thereof, to and including $1,000,000

$5,608.75 for the first $1,000,000 plus $3.65 for each additional
$1,000, or fraction thereof, to and including $5,000,000

$20,208.75 for the first $5,000,000 plus $2.75 for each additional
$1,000, or fraction thereof, to and including $10,000,000

$33,958.75 for the first $10,000,000 plus $2 for each additional
$1,000, or fraction thereof

$501 to $2,000

$2,001 to $25,000

$25,001 to $50,000

$50,001 to $100,000

$100,001 to $500,000

$500,001 to $1,000,000

$1,000,001 to $5,000,000

$5,000,001 to $10,000,000

$10,000,001 and up

« )

c. Fees for Annual Permits. A fee for inspections performed on annual permits shall be charged at the
rate of one hundred dollars ($100) per inspection. The Division shall bill the applicant for annual permits and failure
of the applicant to pay the fee within sixty (60) days may result in cancellation of the annual permit. ( )

d. Plan Review Fees. Plan review fees shall be charged at an hourly rate of one hundred dollars ($100)
per hour up to a maximum of sixty-five percent (65%) of the calculated building permit fee with a minimum required
fee of forty percent (40%) of the calculated building permit fee. All requests for plan review services shall be
accompanied by a payment in the amount of at least forty percent (40%) of the calculated building permit fee. Upon
completion of the plan review, any additional fees, above the minimum required, are due to the Division by the
requesting party. ( )

501. -- 599. (RESERVED)
600. IDAHO BUILDING CODES.

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 407 September 6, 2023 — Vol. 23-9



DIVISION OF OCCUPATIONAL& PROFESSIONAL LICENSES Docket No. 24-3930-2302
Rules of Building Safety (Building Code Rules) ZBR Proposed (Fee) Rule

Pursuant to Sections 39-4109 and 39-4109A, Idaho Code, the Board adopts the following international codes with
identified amendments: ( )

01. International Building Code. The 2018 Edition, including appendices pertaining to building
accessibility, with the following amendments: ( )

a. Delete Section 305.2.3 and replace with the following: 305.2.3 Twelve (12) or fewer children in a
dwelling unit. A facility such as the above within a dwelling unit and having twelve (12) or fewer children receiving
such day care shall be classified as a Group R-3 occupancy or shall comply with the International Residential Code.

« )

i. Delete Section 308.2.4 and replace with the following: 308.2.4 Five (5) or fewer persons receiving
custodial care. A facility with five (5) or fewer persons receiving custodial care shall be classified as a Group R-3
occupancy or shall comply with the International Residential Code. ( )
ii. Delete Section 308.3.2 and replace with the following: 308.3.2 Five (5) or fewer persons receiving

medical care. A facility with five (5) or fewer persons receiving medical care shall be classified as a Group R-3
occupancy. ( )
ii. Delete Section 308.5.4 and replace with the following: 308.5.4 Persons receiving care in a dwelling

unit. A facility such as the above within a dwelling unit and having twelve (12) or fewer children receiving day care
or having five (5) or fewer persons receiving custodial care shall be classified as a Group R-3 occupancy or shall

comply with the International Residential Code. ( )
b. Section 310.4: Add the following: “Dwelling units providing day care for twelve (12) or fewer
children”. (
c. Section 310.4.1. Delete and replace with the following: 310.4.1 Care facilities within a dwelling.

Care facilities for twelve (12) or fewer children receiving day care or for five (5) or fewer persons receiving personal
care or custodial care that are within a one- or two-family dwelling are permitted to comply with the International
Residential Code. ( )

d. Add new Section 602.1.2: 602.1.2 Alternative provisions. As an alternative to the construction
types defined in Sections 602.2 through 602.5, buildings and structures erected or to be erected, altered, or extended
in height or area may be classified as construction type IV-A, IV-B, or IV-C in accordance with the provisions
adopted in Paragraph 004.01.b of these rules. Buildings and structures classified as construction type IV-A, IV-B, or
IV-C shall comply with the provisions adopted in Paragraph 004.01.h of these rules and all other applicable

provisions of this code. «C )
e. Table 2902.1 Minimum Number of Required Plumbing Fixtures. Delete footnote ®and replace with
the following: e For business occupancies, excluding restaurants, and mercantile occupancies with an occupant load
of thirty (30) or fewer, service sinks shall not be required. ( )
f. Table 2902.1 Minimum Number of Required Plumbing Fixtures. Delete footnote f and replace with
the following: f Drinking fountains are not required for an occupant load of thirty (30) or fewer. ( )
g. Section 3113 Relocatable Buildings. Delete. ( )
02. International Building Code, 2021 Edition. The following provisions of the 2021 Edition related
to mass timber construction: ( )
a. In Section 202, the definitions of the terms MASS TIMBER; NONCOMBUSTIBLE
PROTECTION (FOR MASS TIMBER) SECONDARY STRUCTURAL MEMBERS; and WALL, LOAD
BEARING; ( )
b. Sections 403.3.2, 508.4.4.1, 509.4.1.1, 602.4 through 602.4.3.6, 703.6, 703.7, 704.4, 722.7 through
722.7.2.2,1705.5.3, 1705.20, 2304.10.1, 3313.1 through 3313.3.3, 3313.5, and 3314.1; ( )

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 408 September 6, 2023 — Vol. 23-9



DIVISION OF OCCUPATIONAL& PROFESSIONAL LICENSES Docket No. 24-3930-2302

Rules of Building Safety (Building Code Rules) ZBR Proposed (Fee) Rule
c. Tables 504.3, 504.4, 506.2, 601, 705.5, 722.7.1(1), 722.7.1(2), and 1705.5.3, including any note
following each table adopted in this subparagraph; and ( )
d. In Chapter 35, the referenced standards ANSI/APA PRG 320—2019: Standard for Performance-

rated Cross-laminated Timber, referenced in Sections 602.4 and 2303.1.4, and ASTM D3498—03(2011): Standard
Specification for Adhesives for Field-Gluing Plywood to Lumber Framing for Floor Systems, referenced in Section

703.7. ( )
03. International Residential Code, 2018 Edition. Parts I, II, III, and IX of the 2018 Edition for one
(1)- and two (2)- family dwellings, with the following amendments: ( )
a. Section R101.2 Scope. Delete the exception and replace with the following: Exception: The

following shall also be permitted to be constructed in accordance with this code: 1. Owner-occupied lodging houses
with five (5) or fewer guestrooms and ten (10) or fewer total occupants. 2. A care facility with five (5) or fewer
persons receiving custodial care within a dwelling unit or single-family dwelling. 3. A care facility for five (5) or
fewer persons receiving personal care that are within a dwelling unit or single-family dwelling. 4. A care facility with

twelve (12) or fewer children receiving day care within a dwelling unit or single-family dwelling. ( )
b. Section R105.2. Amend Item number 7 under the “Building” subheading Replace the words “24
inches (610 mm)” with “four (4) feet (1219) mm)” ( )
c. Section R105.2. Add the following exemption under the “Building” subheading: 11. Flag pol(es.
d. Section R301.2.1.2 Protection of Openings. Delete. ( )
e. Table R302.1(1). Delete and replace with the following:

TABLE R302.1(1) - EXTERIOR WALLS

MINIMUM FIRE
EXTERIOR WALL ELEMENT SILLLELL I:iEI-EgSISTANCE SEPARATION
DISTANCE
1 hour-tested in accordance
with ASTM E 119, UL263, or
Fire-resistance rated Section 703.3 of the International < 3 feet
Walls Building Code with exposure
from both sides
Not fire-resistance rated 0 hours 2 3 feet
1 hour on the underside, or
o Fire-resistance rated heavy timber, or fire 2 2 feet to < 3 feet
Projections retardant-treated wood®P
Not fire-resistance rated 0 hours > 3 feet
Openings Not allowed N/A < 3 feet
in 25% maximum of wall area 0 hours > 3 feet to < 5 feet
Walls Unlimited 0 hours 5 feet
Comply with Section R302.4 < 3 feet
Penetrations All
None required > 3 feet

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 409 September 6, 2023 — Vol. 23-9



DIVISION OF OCCUPATIONAL& PROFESSIONAL LICENSES Docket No. 24-3930-2302
Rules of Building Safety (Building Code Rules) ZBR Proposed (Fee) Rule

For SI: 1 foot = 304.8 mm.
N/A = Not Applicable
aThe fire-resistance rating shall be permitted to be reduced to zero (0) hours on the underside of the eave
overhanghif fireblocking is provided from the wall top plate to the underside of the roof sheathing.
The fire-resistance rating shall be permitted to be reduced to zero (0) hours on the underside of the rake

overhang where gable vent openings are not installed. ( )
f. Delete Table R302.6 Dwelling-Garage Separation and replace with the following table:
Separation Material

From the residence, attics, and habitable rooms above

the garage Not less than 5/8-inch Type X gypsum board or
equivalent applied to the garage side

Structure(s) supporting floor/ceiling assemblies used for
separation required by this section

Garages located less than 3 feet from a dwelling unit on Not less than 5/8-inch Type X gypsum board or
equivalent applied to the interior side of exterior walls that

the same lot
are within this area
«C )
g. Section R302.13 Fire protection of floors. Delete. ( )
h. Section R303.4. Delete and replace with the following: Mechanical Ventilation. Dwelling units
shall be provided with whole-house mechanical ventilation in accordance with Section M1505.4. ( )
i Section R313.1 Townhouse automatic fire sprinkler systems. Delete the exception and replace with

the following: Exception: Automatic residential fire sprinkler systems shall not be required in townhouses where
either two (2) one (1)-hour fire-resistance-rated walls or a common two (2)-hour fire-resistance rated wall, as
specified in item number 2 of Section R302.2.2 is installed between dwelling units or when additions or alterations

are made to existing townhouses that do not have an automatic residential fire sprinkler system installed. ( )
J- Section R313.2 One- and two-family dwellings automatic fire sprinkler systems. Delete.  ( )
k. Section R314.2.2 Alterations, repairs and additions Exception Item #2. Delete. ( )
L Section R315.2.2 Alterations, repairs and additions Exception Item #2. Delete. ( )
m. Section R322.1.10 As-built elevation documentation. Delete. ( )
n. Tables R403 Minimum Depth (D) and Width (W) of Crushed Stone Footings (inches), R403.1(1)

Minimum Width and Thickness for Concrete Footings for Light-Frame Construction (inches), R403.1(2) Minimum
Width and Thickness for Concrete Footings for Light-Frame Construction and Brick Veneer (inches), and R403.1(3)
Minimum Width and Thickness for Concrete Footings with Cast-In-Place or Fully Grouted Masonry Wall
Construction (inches). Delete. ( )

o. Add the following as Table R403.1: ( )

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 410 September 6, 2023 — Vol. 23-9



DIVISION OF OCCUPATIONAL& PROFESSIONAL LICENSES Docket No. 24-3930-2302
Rules of Building Safety (Building Code Rules) ZBR Proposed (Fee) Rule

TABLE R403.1
MINIMUM WIDTH OF CONCRETE, PRECAST, OR MASONRY FOOTINGS (inches)?

LOAD-BEARING VALUE OF SOIL (psf)
1,500 2,000 3,000 24,000

Conventional light-frame construction
1-Story 12 12 12 12
2-Story 15 12 12 12
3-Story 23 17 12 12

4-inch brick veneer over light frame or 8-inch hollow concrete masonry

1-Story 12 12 12 12
2-Story 21 16 12 12
3-Story 32 24 16 12

8-inch solid or fully grouted masonry
1-Story 16 12 12 12
2-Story 29 21 14 12
3-Story 42 32 21 16

For SI: 1 inch = 25.4 mm, 1 pound per square foot = 0.0479 kPa.
*Where minimum footing width is twelve (12) inches, use of a single wythe of solid or fully grouted twelve (12)-inch
nominal concrete masonry units is permitted. ( )

p. Section R403.1.1. Delete and replace with the following: R403.1.1 Minimum size. Minimum sizes
for concrete and masonry footings shall be as set forth in Table R403.1 and Figure R403.1(1). The footing width (W)
shall be based on the load bearing value of the soil in accordance with Table R401.4.1. Spread footings shall be at
least six (6) inches in thickness (T). Footing projections (P) shall be at least two (2) inches and shall not exceed the
thickness of the footing. The size of footings supporting piers and columns shall be based on the tributary load and
allowable soil pressure in accordance with Table R401.4.1. Footings for wood foundations shall be in accordance
with the details set forth in Section R403.2 and Figures R403.1(2) and R403.1(3). ( )

. Section R602.10. Delete and replace with the following: Buildings shall be braced in accordance
with this Section or, when applicable Section R602.12, or the most current edition of APA System Report SR-102 as
an alternate method. Where a building, or portion thereof, does not comply with one (1) or more of the bracing
requirements in this Section, those portions shall be designed and constructed in accordance with Section R301.1.

«C )

04. International Existing Building Code. 2018 Edition. ( )

05. International Energy Conservation Code — Commercial Provisions. The 2018 Edition with the
following amendments: ( )
a. Add new Section C101.5.2: C101.5.2 Industrial, electronic, and manufacturing equipment.

Buildings or portions thereof that are heated or cooled exclusively to maintain the required operating temperature of
industrial, electronic, or manufacturing equipment shall be exempt from the provisions of this code. Such buildings or
portions thereof shall be separated from connected conditioned space by building thermal envelope assemblies
complying with this code. ( )

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 411 September 6, 2023 — Vol. 23-9



DIVISION OF OCCUPATIONAL& PROFESSIONAL LICENSES
Rules of Building Safety (Building Code Rules)

Docket No. 24-3930-2302
ZBR Proposed (Fee) Rule

b.

1.

1i.

C.

06.

Add the following Exemptions to section C402.1.1:

«C )

Exemption 4. Accessory utility and storage buildings and sports practice buildings accessory to A,
B, and E occupancies where buildings maintain no heating or cooling or where intermittent heating and coohng
systems are installed.

« )

Exemption 5. Buildings for domestic water wells, irrigation wells, sewer pump facilities, and sewer
lift station buildings where equipment produces internal heat loads and where intermittent heating or cooling is
provided to prevent freezing or overheating of equipment.

C )

Add the following as exception number 7 under Section C403.5 Economizers (Prescriptive): 7.
Unusual outdoor air contaminate conditions — Systems where special outside air filtration and treatment for the
reduction and treatment of unusual outdoor contaminants, makes an air economizer infeasible.

«C )

International Energy Conservation Code — Residential Provisions. The 2018 Edition with the

following amendments:

a.

b.

«C )

R202 General Definitions. Add the following to the definition of “Conditioned Space”: This
definition shall not apply to garage spaces or other similar spaces where heating or cooling is installed for frost
protection or intermittent use.

C )

Table R402.1.2 Insulation and Fenestration Requirements by Component. Delete the rows in
climate zones “5 and Marine 4” and “6” and replace with the following:

TABLE R402.1.2
INSULATION AND FENESTRATION REQUIREMENTS BY COMPONENT *#

Glazed WL Basement® Slab Crawlspace®
Climate | Fenestration Skylightb Fenestration Ceiling | Frame | Mass Wall | Floor Wall R-Value Warl,l
Zone U- Factor® | U-factor e R-Value Wall R-Value' | R-Value &
SHGC™ R-Value R-Value
R-Value Depth
5 0.32 0.55 NR 38 1239+%£1 13/17 308 15/19 10, 2 ft 15/19
6 0.30 0.55 NR a9 | 2291 520 308 1519 | 10,4t |  15/19
«C )

C.

Section R402.6.

d.

Table R402.1.2 - Insulation and Fenestration Requirements by Component. Add the following as
footnote k to the Table title: k. For residential log home building thermal envelope construction requirements see

«C )

Table R402.1.4 Equivalent U-Factors. Delete the rows in climate zones “5 and Marine 4 and “6”
and replace with the following:

TABLE R402.1.4

EQUIVALENT U-FACTORS ?

Climate | Fenestration | Skylight | Ceiling Frame Wall | Mass Wall | Floor Basvsglilent Cra\‘llv\;:lr:ace
Zone U-factor U-factor | U-factor U-factor U-factor® | U-factor
U-factor U-factor
5 0.32 0.55 0.030 0.060 0.082 0.033 0.050 0.055
Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 412 September 6, 2023 — Vol. 23-9




DIVISION OF OCCUPATIONAL& PROFESSIONAL LICENSES Docket No. 24-3930-2302
Rules of Building Safety (Building Code Rules) ZBR Proposed (Fee) Rule

TABLE R402.1.4
EQUIVALENT U-FACTORS ?

Climate | Fenestration | Skylight | Ceiling Frame Wall | Mass Wall | Floor Basvs::Ient Cravv\(II:I;I)ace
Zone U-factor U-factor | U-factor U-factor U-factor® | U-factor
U-factor U-factor
6 0.30 0.55 0.026 0.057 0.060 0.033 0.050 0.055
«C )
e. Section R402.4.1.2. Add the following exception: Visual Inspection. The Permit Holder will

determine at the time of permit application the method of determining building envelope tightness. A visual
inspection shall be considered acceptable in lieu of testing when the items listed in Table R402.4.1.1, applicable to the
method of construction, are field verified. ( )

f. Add new Section R402.6: R402.6 Residential log home thermal envelope. Residential log home
construction shall comply with Section R401 (General), Section R402.4 (Air leakage), Section R402.5 (Maximum
fenestration U-factor and SHGC), Section R403.1 (Controls), the mandatory sections of Sections R403.3 through
R403.9, Section R404 (Electrical Power and Lighting Systems), and either 1., 2., or 3. as follows: 1. Sections R402.2
through R402.3, Section R403.3.1 (Insulation), Section R404.1 (Lightning equipment), and Table R402.6 (Log Home
Prescriptive Thermal Envelope Requirements by Component). 2. Section R405 (Simulated Performance Alternative).
3. REScheck (U.S. Department of Energy Building Codes Program). ( )

g. Add new Table R402.6:

TABLE R402.6
LOG HOME PRESCRIPTIVE THERMAL ENVELOPE REQUIREMENTS BY COMPONENT

For Sl: 1 foot = 304.8 mm.

Min.
Glazed Average Basement Slab Crawl
Climate Fenestration | Skylight . Ceiling Floor R-value | Space
a Fenestration Log Wall
Zone U-factor U-factor R-value . R-value d & Wall
SHGC Size In R-value b d
Depth” | R-value
Inches
5, 6 - High
efficiency 0.32 0.60 NR 49 5 30 15119 | 10,4 ft. | 10/13
equipment
path®

3The fenestration U-factor column excludes skylights. The SHGC column applies to all glazed fenestration.
PR-5 shall be added to the required slab edge R-values for heated slabs.

°90% AFUE natural gas or propane, 84% AFUE oil, or 15 SEER heat pump heating equipment (zonal electric resistance
heating equipment such as electric base board electric resistance heating equipment as the sole source for heating is con-
sidered compliant with the high efficiency equipment path).

d«15/19” means R-15 continuous insulated sheathing on the interior or exterior of the home or R-19 cavity insulation at the
interior of the basement wall. “15/19” shall be permitted to be met with R-13 cavity insulation on the interior of the basement
wall plus R-5 continuous insulated sheathing on the interior or exterior of the home. “10/13” means R-10 continuous insu-
lated sheathing on the interior or exterior of the home or R-13 cavity insulation at the interior of the basement wall.

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 413 September 6, 2023 — Vol. 23-9




DIVISION OF OCCUPATIONAL& PROFESSIONAL LICENSES Docket No. 24-3930-2302
Rules of Building Safety (Building Code Rules) ZBR Proposed (Fee) Rule

TABLE R402.6
LOG HOME PRESCRIPTIVE THERMAL ENVELOPE REQUIREMENTS BY COMPONENT

For Sl: 1 foot = 304.8 mm.

Min.
Glazed Average Basement Slab Crawl
Climate Fenestration | Skylight . Ceiling 9 Floor R-value | Space
a Fenestration Log Wwall
Zone U-factor U-factor R-value . R-value d & Wall

SHGC Size In R-value b d

Depth” | R-value

Inches
5 0.32 0.60 NR 49 8 30 10/13 10, 2 ft. 10/13
6 0.30 0.60 NR 49 8 30 15/19 10, 4 ft. 10/13

3The fenestration U-factor column excludes skylights. The SHGC column applies to all glazed fenestration.
PR-5 shall be added to the required slab edge R-values for heated slabs.

“90% AFUE natural gas or propane, 84% AFUE oil, or 15 SEER heat pump heating equipment (zonal electric resistance
heating equipment such as electric base board electric resistance heating equipment as the sole source for heating is con-
sidered compliant with the high efficiency equipment path).

d«15/19” means R-15 continuous insulated sheathing on the interior or exterior of the home or R-19 cavity insulation at the
interior of the basement wall. “15/19” shall be permitted to be met with R-13 cavity insulation on the interior of the basement
wall plus R-5 continuous insulated sheathing on the interior or exterior of the home. “10/13” means R-10 continuous insu-
lated sheathing on the interior or exterior of the home or R-13 cavity insulation at the interior of the basement wall.

«C )
601. -- 999. (RESERVED)

[Agency redlined courtesy copy]
24.39.30 - RULES OF BUILDING SAFETY (BUILDING CODE RULES)

000. LEGALAUTHORITY.
The rules are promulgated pursuant to Sections 33-356, 39-4107,39-4109. 39-4112. 39-4113. 39-9701. Idaho Code.
(4-6-23)T

001. SCOPE.
The rules prescribe the criteria for enforcement and administration of the Idaho Building Code Act by the Idaho

Building Code Board and the Division of Occupational and Professional Licenses_and the integrated design and
fundamental commissioning of public school facilities.(4-6-23)T

002—003-RESERVED)
094600 ADOHIQWGORPORA%I@N—B%FREFERENGEIDAHO BUlLDlNG CODES

Pursuant to Sectlons 39 4109 and 39 4109A Idaho Code the

Board adopts the following international codes with identified amendments: (4-6-23)T

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 414 September 6, 2023 — Vol. 23-9




DIVISION OF OCCUPATIONAL& PROFESSIONAL LICENSES Docket No. 24-3930-2302
Rules of Building Safety (Building Code Rules) ZBR Proposed (Fee) Rule

01. International Building Code._The 2018 Edition, including appendices pertaining to building
accessibility, with the following amendments:(4-6-23)T

ia. Delete Section 305.2.3 and replace with the following: 305.2.3 Twelve (12) or fewer children in a
dwelling unit. A facility such as the above within a dwelling unit and having twelve (12) or fewer children receiving
such day care shall be classified as a Group R-3 occupancy or shall comply with the International Residential Code.

(4-6-23)T

ii. Delete Section 308.2.4 and replace with the following: 308.2.4 Five (5) or fewer persons receiving
custodial care. A facility with five (5) or fewer persons receiving custodial care shall be classified as a Group R-3
occupancy or shall comply with the International Residential Code.(4-6-23)T

iil. Delete Section 308.3.2 and replace with the following: 308.3.2 Five (5) or fewer persons receiving
medical care. A facility with five (5) or fewer persons receiving medical care shall be classified as a Group R-3
occupancy. (4-6-23)T

iv. Delete Section 308.5.4 and replace with the following: 308.5.4 Persons receiving care in a dwelling
unit. A facility such as the above within a dwelling unit and having twelve (12) or fewer children receiving day care
or having five (5) or fewer persons receiving custodial care shall be classified as a Group R-3 occupancy or shall
comply with the International Residential Code.(4-6-23)T

yh. Be}ete—Sectlon 310 4. Add the followms_ “Dwellm; umts r)rOVldms_ daV care for twelve (12) or

= (4 6- 23)T

¥ic. Delete—Section 310.4.1. Delete and replace with the following: 310.4.1 Care facilities within a
dwelling. Care facilities for twelve (12) or fewer children receiving day care or for five (5) or fewer persons receiving
personal care or custodial care that are within a one- or two-family dwelling are permitted to comply with the
International Residential Code.(4-6-23)T

vitld.  Add-thefoHowingasAdd new Section 602.1.2: 602.1.2 Alternative provisions. As an alternative to
the construction types defined in Sections 602.2 through 602.5, buildings and structures erected or to be erected,
altered, or extended in height or area may be classified as construction type IV-A, IV-B, or IV-C in accordance with
the provisions adopted in Paragraph 004.01.b of these rules. Buildings and structures classified as construction type
IV-A, IV-B, or IV-C shall comply with the provisions adopted in Paragraph 004.01.bh of these rules and all other
applicable provisions of this code.(4-6-23)T

vitie.  Delete-footnote-*—ander-Table 2902.1 Minimum Number of Required Plumbing Fixtures, Delete
footnote ¢ and replace with the following: € For business ‘occupancies, excluding restaurants, and mercantile
occupancies with an occupant load of thirty (30) or fewer, service sinks shall not be required.(4-6-23)T

ixf. Be}ete—feeme{e—#—frem—Table 2902 1 Mlnlmum Number of Requrred Plumbmg Fixtures;.—adé

i e-heade h - H and dDelete footnotef
uﬁéer—”l:ab}e—}%Q—l—and replace w1th the followmg Drrnklng fountams are not requlred for an occupant load of
thirty (30) or fewer.(4-6-23)T

xg. Pelete—Section 3113+4_Relocatable Buildings. Delete.-And-—replace—with—the—foHlowing—3H3+

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 415 September 6, 2023 — Vol. 23-9



DIVISION OF OCCUPATIONAL& PROFESSIONAL LICENSES Docket No. 24-3930-2302
Rules of Building Safety (Building Code Rules) ZBR Proposed (Fee) Rule

02. International Building Code. The following provisions of the 2021 Edition related to mass timber
construction:( )

b
to:

ia. In Section 202, the definitions of the terms MASS TIMBER; NONCOMBUSTIBLE

PROTECTION (FOR MASS TIMBER); SECONDARY STRUCTURAL MEMBERS; and WALL, LOAD
BEARING; (4-6-23)T

ib. Sections 403.3.2, 508.4.4.1, 509.4.1.1, 602.4 through 602.4.3.6, 703.6, 703.7, 704.4, 722.7 through
722.7.2.2,1705.5.3, 1705.20, 2304.10. 1, 3313.1 through 3313.3.3,3313.5, and 3314.1; (4 6- 23)T

e, Tables 504.3, 504.4, 506.2, 601, 705.5, 722.7.1(1), 722.7.1(2), and 1705.5.3, including any note
following each table adopted in this subparagraph; and(4-6-23)T

ivd. In Chapter 35, the referenced standards ANSI/APA PRG 320—2019: Standard for Performance-
rated Cross-laminated Timber, referenced in Sections 602.4 and 2303.1.4, and ASTM D3498—03(2011): Standard
Specification for Adhesives for Field-Gluing Plywood to Lumber Framrng for Floor Systems, referenced in Section
703.7. (4-6-23)T

023. International Residential Code. 20H8Edition-with-the fellowingamendmentsParts [, 11, II1, and
IX of the 2018 Edition for one (1)- and two (2)- family dwellings, with the following amendments:(4-6-23)T

a. Section R101.2 Scope. Delete the exception wnder—SeetionRI0d2-Seope—and replace with the
following: Exception: The following shall also be permitted to be constructed in accordance with this code: 1.

Owner-occupied lodging houses with five (5) or fewer guestrooms and ten (10) or fewer total occupants. 2. A care
facility with five (5) or fewer persons receiving custodial care within a dwelling unit or single-family dwelling. 3. A
care facility for five (5) or fewer persons receiving personal care that are within a dwelling unit or single-family
dwelling. 4. A care facility with twelve (12) or fewer children receiving day care within a dwelling unit or single-
family dwelling. (4-6-23)T

b Delete Seetion R104-10-1 Flood hazard-areas-(4-6-23)F

eh. Sectlon R1 05 2. Be}eteAmend iltem number 7 under the “Bulldmg subheadmgei%ee&en—R—l—Oé—Ll

Renlace the words “24 mches (61 0 mm)” w1th “four (4) feet éene—ﬂieus&ﬂd—ﬁve—huﬂdfed—nﬂ&eteen—(nw) mm)”fleeﬁ
(4-6-23)T

dc. Section R105.2. Add the following asexemption #emnamberH-under the “Building” subheading
of Seetion R105-2- Werkexemptfrompermit: 11. Flag poles.(4-6-23)T

£d. Delete-Section R301.2.1.2 Protection of Openings. Delete.(4-6-23)T

ge. Delete-Table R302.1(1). Delete and replace with the following:

TABLE R302.1(1) - EXTERIOR WALLS

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 416 September 6, 2023 — Vol. 23-9



DIVISION OF OCCUPATIONAL& PROFESSIONAL LICENSES

Docket No. 24-3930-2302

Rules of Building Safety (Building Code Rules) ZBR Proposed (Fee) Rule
MINIMUM FIRE
EXTERIOR WALL ELEMENT LI I:ii;SZSISTANCE SEPARATION
DISTANCE
1 hour-tested in accordance
with ASTM E 119, UL263, or
Fire-resistance rated Section 703.3 of the International < 3 feet
Walls Building Code with exposure
from both sides
Not fire-resistance rated 0 hours > 3 feet
1 hour on the underside, or
o Fire-resistance rated heavy timber, or fire 2 2 feet to < 3 feet
Projections retardant-treated wood?®P
Not fire-resistance rated 0 hours > 3 feet
Openings Not allowed N/A < 3 feet
in 25% maximum of wall area 0 hours > 3 feet to < 5 feet
Walls Unlimited 0 hours 5 feet
Comply with Section R302.4 < 3 feet
Penetrations All
None required > 3 feet

For SI: 1 foot =304.8 mm.
N/A = Not Applicable

@ The fire-resistance rating shall be permitted to be reduced to zero (0) hours on the underside of the eave

overhangbif fireblocking is provided from the wall top plate to the underside of the roof sheathing.

The fire-resistance rating shall be permitted to be reduced to zero (0) hours on the underside of the rake

overhang where gable vent openings are not installed.(4-6-23)T

f. Delete Table R302.6 Dwelling-Garage Separation and replace with the following table:

From the residence. attics, and habitable rooms above
the garage

Structure(s) supporting floor/ceiling assemblies used
for separation required by this section

Not less than 5/8-inch Type X gypsum board or equiva-
lent applied to the garage side

Garages located less than 3 feet from a dwelling unit on

Not less than 5/8-inch Type X gypsum board or equiva-

the same lot

lent applied to the interior side of exterior walls that are
within this area

Idaho Administrative Bulletin

Page 417

September 6, 2023 — Vol. 23-9



DIVISION OF OCCUPATIONAL& PROFESSIONAL LICENSES Docket No. 24-3930-2302
Rules of Building Safety (Building Code Rules) ZBR Proposed (Fee) Rule

hf. Delete-Section R302.13 Fire protection of floors. Delete.(4-6-23)T

ig. Delete-Section R303.4. Delete and replace with the following: R363-4-Mechanical Ventilation.
Dwelling units shall be provided with whole-house mechanical ventilation in accordance with Section M1505.4.
(4-6-23)T

fh. Delete-the-exeeptionunder-Section R313.1 Townhouse automatic fire sprinkler systems;. Delete the
exception and replace with the following: Exception: Automatic residential fire sprinkler systems shall not be
required in townhouses where either two (2) one (1)-hour fire-resistance-rated walls or a common two (2)-hour fire-
resistance rated wall, as specified in item number 2 of Section R302.2.2 is installed between dwelling units or when
additions or alterations are made to existing townhouses that do not have an automatic residential fire sprinkler
system installed. (4-6-23)T

ki. Delete-Section R313.2 One- and two-family dwellings automatic fire sprinkler systems. Delete.
(4-6-23)T

lj De}eée—t-he—e*eepﬁeﬂs—uﬂéer—Sectlon R3l4 22 Alteratlons repalrs and add1t10ns E)gceptlon Item

-mk. De}e%e—t-he—e*eepﬁeﬂs—uﬂéer—Sectlon R315 22 Alteratlons repalrs and add1t10ns E)gceptlon Item

seettom (4- 6 23)T
nl. Pelete-Section R322.1.10 As-built elevation documentation. Delete.(4-6-23)T

¢m. Delete-Tables R403 Minimum Depth (D) and Width (W) of Crushed Stone Footings (inches),
R403.1(1) Minimum Width and Thickness for Concrete Footings for Light-Frame Construction (inches), R403.1(2)
Minimum Width and Thickness for Concrete Footings for Light-Frame Construction and Brick Veneer (inches), and
R403.1(3) Minimum Width and Thickness for Concrete Footings with Cast-In-Place or Fully Grouted Masonry Wall
Construction (inches). Delete.(4-6-23)T

¥N. Add the following as Table R403.1:

TABLE R403.1
MINIMUM WIDTH OF CONCRETE, PRECAST, OR MASONRY FOOTINGS (inches)®

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 418 September 6, 2023 — Vol. 23-9



DIVISION OF OCCUPATIONAL& PROFESSIONAL LICENSES

Rules of Building Safety (Building Code Rules)

Docket No. 24-3930-2302
ZBR Proposed (Fee) Rule

LOAD-BEARING VALUE OF SOIL (psf)
1,500 2,000 3,000 24,000

Conventional light-frame construction
1-Story 12 12 12 12
2-Story 15 12 12 12
3-Story 23 17 12 12

4-inch brick veneer over light frame or 8-inch hollow concrete masonry

1-Story 12 12 12 12
2-Story 21 16 12 12
3-Story 32 24 16 12

8-inch solid or fully grouted masonry
1-Story 16 12 12 12
2-Story 29 21 14 12
3-Story 42 32 21 16

For SI: 1 inch = 25.4 mm, 1 pound per square foot = 0.0479 kPa.
@Where minimum footing width is twelve (12) inches, use of a single wythe of solid or fully grouted twelve (12)-inch
nominal concrete masonry units is permitted.(4-6-23)T

0. Delete—Section R403.1.1. Delete and replace with the following: R403.1.1 Minimum size.
Minimum sizes for concrete and masonry footings shall be as set forth in Table R403.1 and Figure R403.1(1). The
footing width (W) shall be based on the load bearing value of the soil in accordance with Table R401.4.1. Spread
footings shall be at least six (6) inches in thickness (T). Footing projections (P) shall be at least two (2) inches and
shall not exceed the thickness of the footing. The size of footings supporting piers and columns shall be based on the
tributary load and allowable soil pressure in accordance with Table R401.4.1. Footings for wood foundations shall be
in accordance with the details set forth in Section R403.2 and Figures R403.1(2) and R403.1(3).(4-6-23)T

tp. Pelete-Section R602.10. Delete and replace with the following: R60210-Wall-braeing—Buildings
shall be braced in accordance with this Section or, when applicable Section R602.12, or the most current edition of
APA System Report SR-102 as an alternate method. Where a building, or portion thereof does not comply with one
(1) or more of the bracing requirements in this Section, those portions shall be designed and constructed in
accordance with Section R301.1.(4-6-23)T

03. International Existing Building Code. 2018 Edition.(4-6-23)T

947 Rtern ‘ o
“4-6-239F
04. International Energy Conservation Code — Commercial Provisions. The 2018 Edition with the
following amendments:( )

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 419 September 6, 2023 — Vol. 23-9



DIVISION OF OCCUPATIONAL& PROFESSIONAL LICENSES Docket No. 24-3930-2302
Rules of Building Safety (Building Code Rules) ZBR Proposed (Fee) Rule

a. Add thefellowing—asnew Section C101.5.2: C101.5.2 Industrial, electronic, and manufacturing
equipment. Buildings or portions thereof that are heated or cooled exclusively to maintain the required operating
temperature of industrial, electronic, or manufacturing equipment shall be exempt from the provisions of this code.
Such buildings or portions thereof shall be separated from connected conditioned space by building thermal envelope
assemblies complying with this code.(4-6-23)T

b. Add the following Exemptions to section C402.1.1:

i Exemptlon 4. Accessory utility and storage buildings and sports practice buildings accessory to A,
B, and E occupancies where buildings maintain no heating or cooling or where intermittent heating and cooling

systems are installed.

il. Exemption 5. Buildings for domestic water wells, irrigation wells, sewer pump facilities, and sewer
lift station buildings where equipment produces internal heat loads and where intermittent heating or cooling is
provided to prevent freezing or overheating of equipment.

c. Add the following as exception number 7 under Section C403.5 Economizers (Prescriptive): 7.
Unusual outdoor air contaminate conditions — Systems where special outside air filtration and treatment for the
reduction and treatment of unusual outdoor contaminants, makes an air economizer infeasible.(4-6-23)T

TABLEC404.54
PNV OLIMEANDMASAVI-RIPING LENGTHS
NOMINAL VOLUME VAU PIRING LENGTHHfeet)
PIRESIZ= Hige-etises
. Otherfdures
tinches) perfoetiength) Public-lavatory-faueets ;
aheappianees
HA 033 34 56
548 85 BLA—peR-stepdare-size 50
348 75 17 50
12 45 48 43
548 2 # 32

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 420 September 6, 2023 — Vol. 23-9



DIVISION OF OCCUPATIONAL& PROFESSIONAL LICENSES

Docket No. 24-3930-2302

Rules of Building Safety (Building Code Rules) ZBR Proposed (Fee) Rule
34 3 5 24
8 4 MLA—pen-slondardsize 16
1 5 3 13
+H4 8 2 8
142 EEL £l 6
2 orlarger 18 El 4

05.
following amendments:(

International Energy Conservation Code — Residential Provisions. The 2018 Edition with the

)

a.

R202 General Definitions. Add the following to the definition of “Conditioned Space”: This

definition shall not apply to garage spaces or other similar spaces where heating or cooling is installed for frost
protection or intermittent use.

the rows in-fe climate zones “5 and Marine 4” and “6” and replace with the following:

eb.

)

Delete-the rows-in-Table R402.1.2 Insulation and Fenestration Requirements by Component. Delete

TABLE R402.1.2
INSULATION AND FENESTRATION REQUIREMENTS BY COMPONENT *#

Wood d

. . Glazed . Basement® | S!12P" | Crawispace

Climate | Fenestration | skylight® | popestration | Ceiling | Frame | Mass Wall | Fioor Wall R-Value ¢ Wall

Zone U- Factor® | U-factor e R-Value Wall R-Value! | R-Value &
SHGC R-Value R-Value Depth R-Value
20 or
5 0.32 0.55 NR 38 1345h 13/17 308 15/19 10, 2 ft 15/19
6 0.30 0 NR 49 22 or 15/20 g 15/19 10, 4 ft 15/19
' 55 13+5h 30 )
(4-6-23)T

fc.

C Add—the—feﬂewmg—&s—fee%&e&e—k—te—fhe—&ﬂe—ef—Table R402.1.2 - Insulation and Fenestration
Requirements by Component. Add the following as footnote to the Table title: * For residential log home building

Idaho Administrative Bulletin

Page 421

September 6, 2023 — Vol. 23-9




DIVISION OF OCCUPATIONAL& PROFESSIONAL LICENSES
Rules of Building Safety (Building Code Rules)

Docket No. 24-3930-2302

ZBR Proposed (Fee) Rule

thermal envelope construction requirements see Section R402.6.(4-6-23)T

gd.
and Marine 4” and “6” and replace with the following:

Delete-the rows—in-Table R402.1.4 Equivalent U-Factors. Delete the rows in fer-climate zones “5

TABLE R402.1.4
EQUIVALENT U-FACTORS 2
Crawl

Climate |Fenestration | Skylight| Ceiling | Frame Wall | MassWall | Floor Ba‘sl:la::Ient ra\‘llvvzlrl)ace
Zone U-factor | U-factor | U-factor |  U-factor U-factor® | U-factor | or U-factor

5 0.32 0.55 0.030 0.060 0.082 0.033 0.050 0.055

6 0.30 505 0.026 0.057 0.060 0.033 0.050 0.055

(4-6-23)T

ke. Add—thefolloewing—as—Section R402.4.1.32.: R402:41+3 Add the following exception: Visual

ilnspection. The Permit Holder will determine at the time of permit application the method of determining Bbuilding
envelope tightness.-and-insulation—installatien A visual inspection shall be considered acceptable_in lieu of testing

when the items listed in Table R402.4.1.1, applicable to the method of construction, are field verified. - Whererequired

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 422 September 6, 2023 — Vol. 23-9



DIVISION OF OCCUPATIONAL& PROFESSIONAL LICENSES Docket No. 24-3930-2302
Rules of Building Safety (Building Code Rules) ZBR Proposed (Fee) Rule

msu—l-&&eﬁ—(4 6 23)T

. Add-thefolewing-as-Add new Section R402.6: R402.6 Residential log home thermal envelope.
Residential log home construction shall comply with Section R401 (General), Section R402.4 (Air leakage), Section
R402.5 (Maximum fenestration U-factor and SHGC), Section R403.1 (Controls), the mandatory sections of Sections
R403.3 through R403.9, Section R404 (Electrical Power and Lighting Systems), and either 1., 2., or 3. as follows: 1.
Sections R402.2 through R402.3, Section R403.3.1 (Insulation), Section R404.1 (Lightning equipment), and Table
R402.6 (Log Home Prescriptive Thermal Envelope Requirements by Component). 2. Section R405 (Simulated
Performance Alternative). 3. REScheck (U.S. Department of Energy Building Codes Program).(4-6-23)T

mg. Add thefelHowingasnew Table R402.6:

TABLE R402.6
LOG HOME PRESCRIPTIVE THERMAL ENVELOPE REQUIREMENTS BY COMPONENT

For SI: 1 foot = 304.8 mm.

Glazed AMi"' Basement | _S1aP Crawl
Climate | Fenestration | skylight azed Ceiling | "\V€'9 | Fioor Wall R-value | Space
Fenestration e Log a & Wall
Zone U-factor?® U-factor SHGC R-value Si R-value d a
ize In R-value Depth? d
Inches epth” | R-value
5, 6 - High
efficiency
equipment 0.32 0.60 NR 49 5 30 15/19 10,4 ft. | 10/13
path®
5 0.32 0.60 NR 49 8 30 10/13 10,2 ft. | 10/13
6 0.30 0.60 NR 49 8 30 15/19 10,4 ft. | 1013

aThe fenestration U-factor column excludes skylights. The SHGC column applies to all glazed fenestration.
bR-5 shall be added to the required slab edge R-values for heated slabs.

°90% AFUE natural gas or propane, 84% AFUE oil, or 15 SEER heat pump heating equipment (zonal electric resistance
heating equipment such as electric base board electric resistance heating equipment as the sole source for heating is
considered compliant with the high efficiency equipment path).

d415/19” means R-15 continuous insulated sheathing on the interior or exterior of the home or R-19 cavity insulation at the
interior of the basement wall. “15/19” shall be permitted to be met with R-13 cavity insulation on the interior of the base-
ment wall plus R-5 continuous insulated sheathing on the interior or exterior of the home. “10/13” means R-10 continuous
insulated sheathing on the interior or exterior of the home or R-13 cavity insulation at the interior of the basement wall.

(4-6-23)T

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 423 September 6, 2023 — Vol. 23-9




DIVISION OF OCCUPATIONAL& PROFESSIONAL LICENSES Docket No. 24-3930-2302
Rules of Building Safety (Building Code Rules) ZBR Proposed (Fee) Rule

021. Listing Agency. A person, firm, association, partnership or corporation which is in the business of
listing or labeling and which maintains a periodic inspection program on current production of listed materials, and
which makes available, not less frequently than annually, a published report of such listing in which specific
information is included that the product has been tested to nationally approved standards and found safe for use in a

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 424 September 6, 2023 — Vol. 23-9



DIVISION OF OCCUPATIONAL& PROFESSIONAL LICENSES Docket No. 24-3930-2302
Rules of Building Safety (Building Code Rules) ZBR Proposed (Fee) Rule

specified manner. (4-6-23)T

032. Minor Alteration. The following definition is used for the purpose of administering annual
permits. (4-6-23)T

a. Minor alterations shall include, but are not limited to, the following: partition walls constructed
within a defined room; relocation of or existing openings or installation of new doors and windows in non-load
bearing walls and not in construction meant to compartmentalize fire; window replacement in unaltered existing
openings; roof repairs involving installation of less than one hundred (100) square feet of new roof covering; and new
suspended ceilings that are not part of a required fire resistive assembly.(4-6-23)T

b. Minor alterations shall not include: work that alters the fire resistive characteristics of the building
or fire suppression systems; work that creates new openings in construction meant to compartmentalize fire such as
fire walls, fire barriers, fore partitions, smoke barriers, smoke partitions, horizontal assemblies, shaft enclosures, stair
enclosures; work that increases the floor area or height of the building; work that changes the structural load path of
the building for gravity or horizontal loads; work that reduces the thermal resistant capacity of the building envelop;
changes in the occupancy classification of the building or space; increases in the floor loads.(4-6-23)T

027500. PERMITS AND PLAN REVIEW.

021. Annual Permit. In lieu of an individual permit for each minor alteration to an already approved
building, the Division may issue an annual permit upon application therefor to any state agency or state governmental
organization regularly employing one (1) or more qualified trade persons in the building, structure or on the premises
or campus owned or operated by the applicant for the permit. The agency to whom an annual permit is issued shall
keep a detailed record of alterations made under such annual permit. The Division shall be allowed access to such
records at-al-timesupon request or such records shall be filed with the Division as designated. The permit holder shall
request inspections and make the work accessible for inspection as required by the adopted codes and this+uleherein.
(4-6-23)T

032. Plans Not Required. Plans are not required for group U occupancies of Type V conventional light-
frame wood construction.(4-6-23)T

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 425 September 6, 2023 — Vol. 23-9



DIVISION OF OCCUPATIONAL& PROFESSIONAL LICENSES Docket No. 24-3930-2302
Rules of Building Safety (Building Code Rules) ZBR Proposed (Fee) Rule

03. Fees.
Ha. Technical Service Fee. One hundred dollars ($100) per hour.(4-6-23)T
02b Building Permit Fees.

The determination of value or valuation will be made by the administrator and includes the total value of all
construction work for which a permit is issued.

FABLE4+-A—BUILDING PERMIT FEES

Total Valuation Fee

$1 to $500 = $23.50

$23.50 for the first $500 plus $3.05 for each additional $100, or
fraction thereof, to and including $2,000

$69.25 for the first $2,000 plus $14 for each additional $1,000, or
fraction thereof, to and including $25,000

$391.75 for the first $25,000 plus $10.10 for each additional
$1,000, or fraction thereof, to and including $50,000

$643.75 for the first $50,000 plus $7 for each additional $1,000,
or fraction thereof, to and including $100,000

$993.75 for the first $100,000 plus $5.60 for each additional
$1,000, or fraction thereof, to and including $500,000

$3,233.75 for the first $500,000 plus $4.75 for each additional
$1,000, or fraction thereof, to and including $1,000,000

$5,608.75 for the first $1,000,000 plus $3.65 for each additional
$1,000, or fraction thereof, to and including $5,000,000

$20,208.75 for the first $5,000,000 plus $2.75 for each additional
$1,000, or fraction thereof, to and including $10,000,000

$33,958.75 for the first $10,000,000 plus $2 for each additional
$1,000, or fraction thereof

$501 to $2,000 =

$2,001 to $25,000 =

$25,001 to $50,000 =

$50,001 to $100,000 =

$100,001 to $500,000 =

$500,001 to $1,000,000 =

$1,000,001 to $5,000,000 | =

$5,000,001 to $10,000,000 | =

$10,000,001 and up =

(4-6-23)T

03c. Fees for Annual Permits. A fee for inspections performed on annual permits shall be charged at the
rate of one hundred dollars ($100) per heurinspection. The Division shall bill the applicant for annual permits and
failure of the applicant to pay the fee within sixty (60) days may result in cancellation of the annual permit.
(4-6-23)T

04d. Plan Review Fees. Plan review fees shall be charged at an hourly rate of one hundred dollars ($100)
per hour up to a maximum of sixty-five percent (65%) of the calculated building permit fee with a minimum required
fee of forty percent (40%) of the calculated building permit fee. All requests for plan review services shall at-saeh
time-be accompanied by a payment in the amount of at least forty percent (40%) of the calculated building permit fee.
Upon completion of the plan review, any additional fees, above the minimum required, are due to the Division by the

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 426 September 6, 2023 — Vol. 23-9



DIVISION OF OCCUPATIONAL& PROFESSIONAL LICENSES Docket No. 24-3930-2302
Rules of Building Safety (Building Code Rules) ZBR Proposed (Fee) Rule

requesting party.(4-6-23)T

038200. INTEGRATED DESIGN AND FUNDAMENTAL COMMISSIONING OF PUBLIC SCHOOL
FACILITIES.

021. Technical and Educational Information. Technical and educational information related to
integrated design and fundamental commissioning in the form of the American Institute of Architects Integrated
Project Delivery Guide; Portland Energy Conservation, Inc. (PECI) Commissioning Guides; ASHRAE Guideline 0-
2005-The Commrssromng Process; and the Northwest Energy Efficiency Alliance Integrated Design Special Focus
on Energy Performance Gulde is avallable aton the D1V1s1on s—eﬁﬂee—}ee&&eﬂs—me}udmg—}G9G—E—W&teﬁewer—St—,

4. A building commissioned
under the prescrrptrve approaches deﬁned by any of the above named natronal organlzatlons is deemed to have
completed the Fundamental Commissioning process.(4-6-23)T

032. Commissioning Agents. The Division has compiled and made available for public examination a

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 427 September 6, 2023 — Vol. 23-9



DIVISION OF OCCUPATIONAL& PROFESSIONAL LICENSES Docket No. 24-3930-2302
Rules of Building Safety (Building Code Rules) ZBR Proposed (Fee) Rule

list of all known third party building commissioning agents in Idaho and its contiguous states. The Division has
ensured that all such commissioning agents appearing on this list have been certified by the Building Commissioning
Association (BCA) or other similar certifying entity.(4-6-23)T

043. Annual Optimization Review.(4-6-23)T

The thlrd Dartv commissioning a;_ent who performed the mltlal fundamental commlssmmm_ for a

public school building must provide the school district with a written report identifying the systems which will be
subject to the Idaho Code Section 33-356 annual optimization review and identifying the system requirements and/or
other relevant measuring criteria.(4-6-23)F

& _The repertwritten report required-abeve-inParagraph-038-04-b—of theserules-shall, at a minimum
includesbutisnetlimited-te;atleast the following:(4-6-23)T

i. Verification that the heating, ventilation, and air conditioning (HVAC) systems. controls, dampers,
valves, sensors and other equipment used to control the system are functioning as they were at the commissioning of
the bulldlng- (4-6-23)T

il. Verification that the lighting controls are functioning as they were at the commissioning of the
building:; and  4-6-23)F
iil. The requirement that any changes made to any of the controls contained on the agent’s list after the

initial commissioning be re-set back to the commissioned settings unless it can be demonstrated that the new settings
result in greater energy efficiency.(4-6-23)T

db. The annual optimization review shall be performed by persons qualified to make the required
determinations and adjustments.(4-6-23)T

ec. FFollowing the annual optimization review, the school district shall submit to the Division written
verification indicating (1)that the systems identified by the commissioning agent, including those identified in this
Section are functioning as they were at the initial commissioning; and (2)—Sueh—written—verifieation—shall-alse
identifying the persons performing the optimization and their qualifications.(4-6-23)T

055. Commissioning Anniversary Date. The date upon which the commissioning agent provides the
school district with the required written report described in Paragraph 038.04.b. of these rules shall be the
commissioning anniversary date for purposes of this Section. If a school district seeks to qualify a building for the
building replacement value calculation, the annual optimization review shall be performed within thirty (30) days of
the annual commissioning anniversary date following the first year the building is in operation. The written
verification required by Paragraph 038.03.e. of these rules is due to the Division not later than sixty (60) days after
the annual commissioning anniversary date.(4-6-23)T

063. Fundamental Building Commissioning Requirements.(4-6-23)T

a. School districts seeking to qualify a building for the building replacement value calculation shall
engage a building commissioning agent.(4-6-23)T

b. The commissioning agent must document the owner’s requirements for each commissioned system
in the facility. All HVAC and controls systems, duct work and piping, renewable and alternative technologies,

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 428 September 6, 2023 — Vol. 23-9



DIVISION OF OCCUPATIONAL& PROFESSIONAL LICENSES Docket No. 24-3930-2302
Rules of Building Safety (Building Code Rules) ZBR Proposed (Fee) Rule

lighting controls and day lighting, waste heat recovery, and any other advanced technologies incorporated in the
building must be commissioned. Building envelope systems must also be verified. The owner’s requirements for
these systems may include efficiency targets and other performance criteria such as temperature and lighting levels
that will define the performance criteria for the functional performance testing that occurs prior to acceptance.(4-6-
23)T

c. The commissioning agent shall include commissioning requirements in the project construction
documents. This includes the scope of commissioning for the project, the systems to be commissioned, and the
various requirements related to schedule, submittal reviews, testing, training, O & M manuals, and warranty reviews.
(4-6-23)T

d. The commissioning agent shall develop and utilize a commissioning plan. This plan must include
an overview of the commissioning process for the project, a list of commissioned systems, primary commissioning
participants and their roles, a communication and management plan, an outline of the scope of commissioning tasks,
a list of work products, a schedule, and a description of any commissioning testing activities.(4-6-23)T

e. The commissioning agent must submit a report to the owner once the commissioning plan has been
executed. (4-6-23)T
839—999-(RESERVED)

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 429 September 6, 2023 — Vol. 23-9



PROPOSED RULE COST/BENEFIT ANALYSIS

Section 67-5223(3), Idaho Code, requires the preparation of an economic impact statement for all proposed rules
imposing or increasing fees or charges. This cost/benefit analysis, which must be filed with the proposed rule, must
include the reasonably estimated costs to the agency to implement the rule and the reasonably estimated costs to be
borne by citizens, or the private sector, or both.

Department or Agency: Division of Occupational and Professional Licenses

Agency Contact: Michael Hyde Phone: (208) 332-7133

Date: 8/4/2023

IDAPA, Chapter and Title Number and Chapter Name:

24.39.30- Rules of Building Safety

Fee Rule Status: X Proposed Temporary
Rulemaking Docket Number: 24-3930-2302
STATEMENT OF ECONOMIC IMPACT: This rulemaking does not impose a new fee or charge, or increase

a fee or charge, beyond what was previously submitted to and reviewed by the Idaho Legislature in the prior
rules.

The following is a specific description of the fees or charges:

01. Building Permit Fees

BUILDING PERMIT FEES
Total Valuation Fee
$1 to $500 = $23.50

$23.50 for the first $500 plus $3.05 for each additional $100, or

$501 to $2,000 " fraction thereof, to and including $2,000

$69.25 for the first $2,000 plus $14 for each additional $1,000,

$2,001 to $25,000 ~  or fraction thereof, to and including $25,000

$391.75 for the first $25,000 plus $10.10 for each additional

$25,001 to $50,000 N $1,000, or fraction thereof, to and including $50,000

$643.75 for the first $50,000 plus $7 for each additional $1,000,

$50,001 to $100,000 " or fraction thereof, to and including $100,000

Page 1 of 1



$993.75 for the first $100,000 plus $5.60 for each additional

$100,001 to $500,000 - $1,000, or fraction thereof, to and including $500,000

$3,233.75 for the first $500,000 plus $4.75 for each additional

§500,001 to $1,000,000 1= ¢1"600 or fraction thereof, to and including $1,000,000

$5,608.75 for the first $1,000,000 plus $3.65 for each additional

$1,000,001 10 85,000,000 1= ¢}"600 or fraction thereof, o and including $5,000,000

$20,208.75 for the first $5,000,000 plus $2.75 for each additional

$5,000,001 to $10,000,000 | = $1,000, or fraction thereof, to and including $10,000,000

$33,958.75 for the first $10,000,000 plus $2 for each additional

$10,000,001 and up N $1,000, or fraction thereof

02. Fees for Annual Permits.
A fee for inspections performed on annual permits shall be charged at the rate of one hundred dollars ($100) per inspection. The Division

shall bill the applicant for annual permits and failure of the applicant to pay the fee within sixty (60) days may result in cancellation of
the annual permit.

03. Plan Review Fees.
Plan review fees shall be charged at an hourly rate of one hundred dollars ($100) per hour up to a maximum of sixty-five percent (65%)
of the calculated building permit fee with a minimum required fee of forty percent (40%) of the calculated building permit fee. All
requests for plan review services shall at such time be accompanied by a payment in the amount of at least forty percent (40%) of the
calculated building permit fee. Upon completion of the plan review, any additional fees, above the minimum required, are due to the
Division by the requesting party.

04. Technical Service Fee.

One hundred dollars ($100) per hour.

Page 2 of 2



INCORPORATION BY REFERENCE SYNOPSIS

In compliance with Section 67-5223(4), Idaho Code, the following is a synopsis of the differences
between the materials previously incorporated by reference in this rule that are currently of full
force and effect and newly revised or amended versions of these same materials that are being
proposed for incorporation by reference under this rulemaking.

The following agency of the state of Idaho has prepared this synopsis as part of the proposed
rulemaking for the chapter cited here under the docket number specified:

IDAPA 24 — Division of Occupational and Professional Licenses
24.39.30 — Rules of Building Safety
Proposed Rulemaking - Docket No. 24-3930-2302

The proposed rulemaking adopts and incorporates the following:
International Building Code. The 2018 Edition

International Residential Code. Parts I, II, III, and IX of the 2018 Edition for one (1)- and two
(2)- family dwellings

International Existing Building Code. 2018 Edition.
International Energy Conservation Code — Commercial Provisions. The 2018 Edition.

International Energy Conservation Code — Residential Provisions. The 2018 Edition.



IDAPA 24 — DIVISION OF OCCUPATIONAL AND PROFESSIONAL LICENSES
24.39.31 — RULES FOR FACTORY BUILT STRUCTURES
DOCKET NO. 24-3931-2301 (ZBR CHAPTER REWRITE, FEE RULE)
NOTICE OF RULEMAKING - PROPOSED RULE

AUTHORITY: In compliance with Section 67-5221(1), Idaho Code, notice is hereby given that this agency has
initiated proposed rulemaking procedures. This rulemaking action is authorized pursuant to Section 67-2604, Idaho
Code, and Sections 39-4003, 39-4302, 44-2102, 44-2104, 44-2201, 44-2202, 67-2614, 67-9406, and 67-9409, Idaho
Code.

PUBLIC HEARING SCHEDULE: The public hearing concerning this rulemaking will be held as follows:

Wednesday, September 20, 2023, 9:00 a.m. MT

Division of Occupational and Professional Licenses
Chinden Campus Building 4
11341 W. Chinden Blvd., Bldg. #4
Boise, ID 83714

Telephone and web conferencing information will be posted on:
https://dopl.idaho.gov/calendar/ and https://townhall.idaho.gov/

The hearing site will be accessible to persons with disabilities, if needed. Requests for accommodation must be
made not later than five (5) days prior to the meeting to the agency address below.

DESCRIPTIVE SUMMARY AND STATEMENT OF PURPOSE: The following is a nontechnical explanation of
the substance and purpose of the proposed rulemaking:

Under Executive Order 2020-01, Zero-Based Regulation, the Factory Built Structures Advisory Board is striving
to prevent the accumulation of costly, ineffective, and outdated regulations and reduce regulatory burden to achieve a
more efficient operation of government. In conjunction with stakeholders, the proposed rule changes reflect a
comprehensive review of this chapter by collaborating with the public to streamline or simplify the rule language in
this chapter and to use plain language for better understanding. This proposed rulemaking updates the rules to comply
with governing statute and Executive Order 2020-01.

FEE SUMMARY: The following is a specific description of the fee or charge imposed or increased:
The fees for applications, licenses, and reinstatement as designated in Rule 400 of these proposed rules are
authorized in Section 44-2104, Idaho Code. None of these fees are being changed as a result of this rulemaking or

since being previously reviewed by the Idaho legislature.

FISCAL IMPACT: The following is a specific description, if applicable, of any negative fiscal impact on the state
general fund greater than ten thousand dollars ($10,000) during the fiscal year as a result of this rulemaking:

This rulemaking is not anticipated to have any negative fiscal impact on the State General Fund.
NEGOTIATED RULEMAKING: Pursuant to Section 67-5220, Idaho Code, negotiated rulemaking was conducted

under Docket No. 24-ZBRR-2301. The (Second) Omnibus Notice of Intent to Promulgate Rules - Negotiated
Rulemaking was published in the June 7, 2023 Idaho Administrative Bulletin, Vol. 23-6, pp. 75-76.

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 430 September 6, 2023 — Vol. 23-9


https://gov.idaho.gov/wp-content/uploads/2020/01/eo-2020-01.pdf
https://dopl.idaho.gov/calendar/
https://townhall.idaho.gov/
https://adminrules.idaho.gov/bulletin/2023/06.pdf#page=75

DIVISION OF OCCUPATIONAL& PROFESSIONAL LICENSES Docket No. 24-3931-2301
Rules for Factory Built Structures ZBR Proposed (Fee) Rule

INCORPORATION BY REFERENCE: Pursuant to Section 67-5229(2)(a), Idaho Code, the following is a brief
synopsis of why the materials cited are being incorporated by reference into this rule:

The Idaho Manufactured Home Installation Standard (January 1, 2018 edition).

The materials cited are incorporated by reference because they would be unduly cumbersome, expensive, or
otherwise inexpedient to republish all or in part. The materials cited are codes, standards, or rules adopted by a
nationally recognized organization or association.

ASSISTANCE ON TECHNICAL QUESTIONS, SUBMISSION OF WRITTEN COMMENTS, OBTAINING
DRAFT COPIES: For assistance on technical questions concerning this proposed rule, contact Katie Stuart,
Administration Bureau Chief, at (208) 577-2489. Materials pertaining to the proposed rulemaking, including any
available preliminary rule drafts, can be found on the following DOPL website: https://dopl.idaho.gov/rulemaking/.

Anyone may submit written comments regarding this proposed rulemaking. All written comments must be
directed to the undersigned and must be delivered on or before September 27, 2023.

DATED this 8th day of August, 2023.

Katie Stuart

Bureau Chief

11341 W. Chinden Blvd., Bldg. #4
Boise, ID 83714

Phone: (208) 577-2489

Email: katie.stuart@dopl.idaho.gov
Website: https://dopl.idaho.gov/

THE FOLLOWING IS THE PROPOSED TEXT OF FEE DOCKET NO. 24-3931-2301
(ZBR Chapter Rewrite)

*Note — Due to extensive reorganization of this ZBR chapter, the rule text below is presented as clean text without showing
amendments in legislative format. A redline copy provided by the agency has been included at the end of the docket for transparency
and can be utilized to track all edits used to formulate the proposed rule.

24.39.31 — RULES FOR FACTORY BUILT STRUCTURES

000. LEGAL AUTHORITY.
These rules are promulgated pursuant to Sections 39-4003, 39-4302, 44-2102, 44-2104, 44-2201, and 44-2202, Idaho
Code. ( )

001. SCOPE.

These rules govern the manufacture and installation of modular buildings in Idaho, apply to persons engaged in the
business of manufacturing, selling, or installing manufactured or mobile homes for purposes of human habitation in
Idaho, apply to disputes between persons licensed as manufacturers, retailers, and installers of manufactured homes,
and apply to the installation of manufactured or mobile homes in Idaho. ( )

002. INCORPORATION BY REFERENCE.
The Idaho Manufactured Home Installation Standard (January 1, 2018 edition), is hereby adopted and incorporated
by reference and is available on the DOPL website: https://dopl.idaho.gov. ( )

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 431 September 6, 2023 — Vol. 23-9


https://dopl.idaho.gov/
https://dopl.idaho.gov/rulemaking/
https://dopl.idaho.gov
mailto: katie.stuart@dopl.idaho.gov

DIVISION OF OCCUPATIONAL& PROFESSIONAL LICENSES Docket No. 24-3931-2301
Rules for Factory Built Structures ZBR Proposed (Fee) Rule

003. DEFINITIONS.
The terms defined in this section have the following meaning, unless the context clearly indicates another meaning.

« )

01. Alterations to Manufactured Homes. The replacement, addition, and modification, or removal of
any equipment or installation after sale by a manufacturer to a retailer but prior to sale by a retailer to a purchaser
which may affect the construction, fire safety, occupancy, plumbing, heat-producing or electrical system. It does not
include the addition of an appliance requiring “plug-in” to an electrical receptacle, which appliance was not provided
with the manufactured home by the manufacturer, if the rating of the appliance does not exceed the rating of the

receptacle to which it is connected. ( )
02. Deceptive Practice. Intentionally publishing or circulating any advertising concerning mobile or
manufactured homes which: ( )
a. Is misleading or inaccurate in any material respect; ( )
b. Misrepresents any of the products or services sold or provided by a manufacturer, manufactured/
mobile home retailer, or installation company. ( )
03. Insignia. A label or tag issued by the Division to indicate compliance with the codes, standards,
rules, and regulations established for Modular Buildings and Commercial Coaches. ( )
04. Installation. The complete operation of fixing in place a modular building or manufactured or
mobile home for occupancy. ( )
05. Principal Place of Business. The primary physical location at which the business of a

manufactured home retailer is lawfully conducted. Each of the following requirements must be met to qualify as the

principal place of business: (
a. The business of the manufactured or mobile home retailer is lawfully conducted here; ( )
b. The office or offices of the retailer is or are located here; ( )
c. The public may contact the retailer here; ( )
d. The offices are accessible and open to the public; and ( )
e. The greatest portion of the retailer’s business is conducted here. The books and other records of a

retailer must be kept and maintained at the retailer’s principal place of business and be open to inspection during
normal business hours by any authorized agent of the Division. Moreover, there must be displayed on the exterior a
sign permanently affixed to the land or building with letters providing the business name of the retailer clearly visible

to the major avenue of traffic. ( )
06. Used Manufactured Home or Mobile Home. A manufactured home or mobile home,
respectively, which has been: ( )
a. Sold, rented, or leased and occupied prior to or after the sale, rental, or lease; or ( )
b. Registered with or been the subject of a certificate of title issued by the Idaho Department of
Transportation or the appropriate authority of any state, the District of Columbia, or foreign state or country. ( )

004. -- 099, (RESERVED)
100. LICENSURE.

01. Manufactured/Mobile Home Licensure. ( )

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 432 September 6, 2023 — Vol. 23-9



DIVISION OF OCCUPATIONAL& PROFESSIONAL LICENSES Docket No. 24-3931-2301
Rules for Factory Built Structures ZBR Proposed (Fee) Rule

a. Minimum Age Requirement. No license will be issued to a person under eighteen (18) years of age
at the time of license application. ( )

b. Designated License Holder. Any applicant for a license under who is not a natural person must
designate a natural person to be license holder and represent the corporation, partnership, trust, society, club,
association, or other organization for all licensing purposes under these rules including, but not limited to, testing and
education. No issued licenses are transferable. ( )

1. Any person represents one (1) applicant only, and must immediately notify the Division in writing
if his working relationship with the applicant has been terminated. The license will be issued in the name of the
designated license holder with the name of the organization he represents also noted on the license. The license
holder is considered by the Division to be the licensee. ( )

ii. The applicant agrees by acceptance of the designation that the designated person acts as agent of
the applicant for all purposes under Title 44, Chapters 21 and 22, Idaho Code, and all rules promulgated thereunder.

C )

ii. Any license issued to a manufactured/mobile home retailer must be posted in a conspicuous place
on the business premises of the employer for whom the holder of the license is licensed. The license of a
manufacturing facility or branch office must also be posted in a conspicuous place at the location licensed.

«C )
iv. To engage in business in the state of Idaho, each manufacturer must be licensed by the Division.

«C )
\ The Division requires as a condition of licensing any information it deems necessary for each

location where a manufactured/mobile home retailer maintains a branch office. The use of a mobile home park or a
state sales office by a licensee for the sale or offering for sale of manufactured/mobile homes constitutes the
maintenance of a branch office.A retailer must obtain a license from the Division to operate the branch office.

« )

vi. Applicants for a manufacturer's, retailers, or installer's license must furnish: Any proof the Division
may deem necessary that the applicant is a manufacturer, retailer, or installer; any proof the Division may require that
the applicant has a principal place of business; In the case of a retailer in new manufactured homes, an instrument in
the form prescribed by the Division executed by or on behalf of the manufacturer certifying that the applicant is an
authorized franchise retailer for the make concerned; The fee and proof of the bond required by Section 44-2103,

Idaho Code; and Proof of passing the examination required by these rules, as applicable. ( )
vii. Within thirty (30) days after receipt of a completed application, the Division will issue or deny the
license. ( )
viii. Each license is valid for a period of one (1) year from the date of issuance. ( )
02. Proof of Education Required. ( )
a. Satisfactory Proof for Initial Application Submission. An application for a license as a
manufactured/mobile home installer must include proof satisfactory to the Division that the applicant has completed
the following number of hours of initial education in order to be approved: ( )
1. Installers and retailers who are installers: eight (8) hours. ( )
ii. The course of initial education must be approved by the Division and must include information
relating to the provisions of these rules, Title 44, Chapters 21, Idaho Code, and the National Manufactured Housing
Construction and Safety Standards Act of 1974. ( )
b. Satisfactory Proof for License Renewal. The Division will not renew any installer license, or

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 433 September 6, 2023 — Vol. 23-9



DIVISION OF OCCUPATIONAL& PROFESSIONAL LICENSES Docket No. 24-3931-2301
Rules for Factory Built Structures ZBR Proposed (Fee) Rule

retailer license of any retailer who is also an installer, issued pursuant to Title 44, Chapters 21 or 22, Idaho Code, or
these rules until the licensee has submitted proof satisfactory to the Division that he has, during the three (3) years
immediately preceding the renewal of the license, completed at least eight (8) hours of continuing education.

)

i. The course of continuing education must be approved by the Division and include information
germane to the profession. «C )
03. Examination Of Applicant For License. ( )

a. Required Examinations. The Division requires a written examination of each applicant for an initial

license as a manufactured/mobile home retailer or installer. ( )
b. Examination and Grade. No license will be issued unless an applicant receives a final grade of

seventy percent (70%) or higher. ( )

101. -- 299. (RESERVED)

300. DISCIPLINARY ACTION AGAINST LICENSEES, CIVIL PENALTIES, AND CONSUMER
COMPLAINT AND DISPUTE RESOLUTION.

01. The Division may deny, suspend, refuse to renew, or revoke any license or reissue the license
subject to reasonable conditions upon any of the following grounds: ( )

a. Failure to Provide Business Name. Failure to include in any advertising the name of the licensed
retailer or installer. ( )

b. Poor Workmanship. Performing workmanship which is grossly incompetent or repeatedly below
the standards adopted by Title 44, Chapters 21 and 22, the provisions of these rules, or the National Manufactured
Housing Construction and Safety Standards Act of 1974. ( )

c. Failure to Honor Warranties. Failure to honor any warranty or other guarantee given by a licensee
for construction, workmanship, or material as a condition of securing a contract, or of selling, leasing, reconstructing,
improving, repairing, or installing any manufactured/mobile home. ( )

d. Failure to Respond to Notice. Failure to respond to a notice served by the Division. ( )

e. Failure to Permit Access to Documentary Materials. Failure or refusing to permit access by the
Division to relevant documentary materials after being requested to do so by the Division. ( )

f. Conviction of Misdemeanor. Conviction of a misdemeanor for violation of any of the provisions of
Title 44, Chapters 21 or 22, Idaho Code. ( )

g. Conviction of Felony. Conviction or withheld judgment for a felony in this state, any U.S. territory,
or country. ( )

h. Violation of Permit or Inspection Requirements. To knowingly violate any permit or inspection
requirements of any city or county of this state. ( )

02. Modular Civil Penalties. The following acts subject the violator to penalties of not more than two
hundred dollars ($200) for the first offense and not more than one thousand dollars ($1,000) for each offense
thereafter: ( )

a. Installation. Any person who installs a modular building on a building site in this state without first
receiving approval and securing to the structure insignia evidencing such approval from the Division. ( )

b. Modification. Any person who in any way modifies or alters a modular building prior to its initial

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 434 September 6, 2023 — Vol. 23-9



DIVISION OF OCCUPATIONAL& PROFESSIONAL LICENSES Docket No. 24-3931-2301
Rules for Factory Built Structures ZBR Proposed (Fee) Rule

occupancy which has previously been approved by the Division without first having received approval to do so from
the Division. ( )

03. Manufactured Home Civil Penalties. Except as otherwise provided, the following acts subject the
violator to penalties of not more than five hundred dollars ($500) for the first offense and not more than one thousand
dollars ($1,000) for each offense thereafter: ( )

a. Industry Licensing. Except as provided for by Section 44-2106, Idaho Code, any person who
engages in the business of a manufacturer, retailer, or installer, as defined in Section 44-2101A, Idaho Code, without
being duly licensed by the Division. ( )

b. Deceptive Practice. Any retailer or installer who intentionally publishes or circulates any
advertising that is misleading or inaccurate in any material respect or that misrepresents any of the products or
services sold or provided by a manufacturer, retailer, or installer. ( )

c. Dealing with Stolen Manufactured or Mobile Homes. Any person who knowingly purchases, sells,
or otherwise acquires or disposes of a stolen manufactured or mobile home is subject to a civil penalty of not more
than one thousand dollars ($1,000). ( )

d. Failure to Maintain a Principal Place of Business. Any person who is a retailer duly licensed by the
Division and who fails to maintain a principal place of business within Idaho. ( )

e. Violation of Rules and Statutes. Any person who knowingly violates these rules or Title 44,
Chapters 21 or 22, Idaho Code. ( )

f. Gross Violation. In case of continued, repeated, or gross violations of these rules, a license
revocation may be initiated for licensed individuals under Title 44, Chapter 21, Idaho Code. Non-licensed individuals
are subject to prosecution by the appropriate jurisdiction under Idaho law. ( )

04. Consumer Complaints and Dispute Resolution. ( )

a. Site Inspection. The Division may perform a site inspection, based on the nature of a complaint or
upon request of the complainant in accordance with HUD. ( )

b. Fees. A charge for mileage to and from the inspection site, plus an hourly charge for the time spent
conducting the inspection, is assessed the manufacturer, installer, or retailer if a site inspection is made upon a request
by the manufacturer, installer, or retailer, and does not involve a serious defect or imminent safety hazard. ( )

c. Inspection Report. Following a site inspection, the inspector will prepare a final report and include
photographs. ( )

d. Action. A notification letter and copies of the complaint form and investigation findings may be
provided to all involved parties and HUD. ( )

i. Any Division action, notification and follow-up are completed according to HUD guidelines.

« )

ii. If the nature of the complaint pertains to retailer contractual issues or installation problems, a copy
of the complaint is to be consolidated with the appropriate Division license files. ( )

iil. A Division building inspector will issue a report concerning correction or repair of defects that are
a matter of dispute between the homeowner, retailer, installer, or manufacturer. The report will include the likely
cause of the defect and identify the party responsible for creating the defect that is in need of correction or repair.

«C )

e. Decisions. The Administrator will review the inspector’s report and set forth the required corrective
action and identify the party responsible for such action. The Administrator may initiate a contested case proceeding

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 435 September 6, 2023 — Vol. 23-9



DIVISION OF OCCUPATIONAL& PROFESSIONAL LICENSES Docket No. 24-3931-2301
Rules for Factory Built Structures ZBR Proposed (Fee) Rule

if, in his sole discretion, he determines that such a proceeding or further investigation would be of assistance in
reaching a decision. The decision must direct the responsible party to complete the required corrective action within
specified timelines and consider the needs of the involved parties including, but not limited to, safety, anticipated
expense and availability of funds, time of year, and convenience to the parties. ( )

f. Appeals. Decisions of the administrator are final orders for purposes of appeal. ( )

Informal Disposition -- Arbitration -- Mediation. Unless otherwise prohibited by other provisions

of law, 1nf0rmal disposition may be made of any complaint by negotiation, stipulation, agreed settlement, and consent

order. The parties may agree to enter into binding arbitration or mediation. Informal settlement of matters is to be

encouraged. ( )
301. -- 399. (RESERVED)

400. MANUFACTURED/MOBILE HOME LICENSE FEES.

01. Fees for Issuance and Renewal of License. The following fees for the issuance and renewal of a
license will be charged: ( )
a. Manufactured/mobile home retailer license: four hundred forty dollars ($440). Retailers who are
also installers will have to pay an installer's license fee to hold both licenses. ( )
b. Manufacturer license: four hundred forty dollars ($440); ( )
c. Manufactured/mobile home installer license: two hundred twenty dollars ($220); ( )
02. Performance Bonding Requirements. Application for licensing will be accepted when
accompanied by the performance bond required by Section 44-2103, Idaho Code. ( )

401. -- 499. (RESERVED)
500. PERMITS, PLAN REVIEWS, AND INSPECTIONS.

01. Modular Building Permit Fees. Permits must be obtained from the Division prior to the
construction of structures governed by 39-4303, Idaho Code. Other than as specified in this section, the permit fee
schedule for Modular Buildings is as provided in Table 1-A plus ninety dollars ($90) and two and one-half percent
(2.5%) of the plumbing, electrical, and HVAC installation costs. The determination of value or valuation is based on
the total value of all construction work for which a permit is issued.

TABLE 1-A — MODULAR BUILDING PERMIT FEES
TOTAL VALUATION | | FEE
$1 to $500 $23.50
$23.50 for the first $500 plus $3.05 for each additional
$100, or fraction thereof, to and including $2,000

$69.25 for the first $2,000 plus $14 for each additional
$1,000, or fraction thereof, to and including $25,000

$391.75 for the first $25,000 plus $10.10 for each additional
$1,000, or fraction thereof, to and including $50,000

$643.75 for the first $50,000 plus $7 for each additional
$1,000, or fraction thereof, to and including $100,000

$993.75 for the first $100,000 plus $5.60 for each additional
$1,000, or fraction thereof, to and including $500,000

$501 to $2,000

$2,001 to $25,000

$25,001 to $50,000

$50,001 to $100,000

$100,001 to $500,000

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 436 September 6, 2023 — Vol. 23-9



DIVISION OF OCCUPATIONAL& PROFESSIONAL LICENSES Docket No. 24-3931-2301
Rules for Factory Built Structures ZBR Proposed (Fee) Rule

TABLE 1-A — MODULAR BUILDING PERMIT FEES

$3,233.75 for the first $500,000 plus $4.75 for each additional
$1,000, or fraction thereof, to and including $1,000,000

$5,608.75 for the first $1,000,000 plus $3.65 for
each additional $1,000, or fraction thereof

$500,001 to $1,000,000

$1,000,001and up

« )

02. Modular Plan Review. The Modular Building fee includes an additional amount equal to sixty-
five percent (65%) of the permit fee calculated in accordance with Table 1-A. A fee of sixty-five dollars ($65) per
hour applies to additional plan review required by changes, additions, or revisions to plans. ( )

03. Manufactured/Mobile Home Installation Permit Fees. Permits must be obtained from the
Division prior to the site installation governed by 44-2202, and 39-4004, Idaho Code in accordance with the
following schedule: ( )

a. Single Section Unit. The permit fee is one hundred fifty dollars ($150). ( )
b. Double Section Unit. The permit fee is two hundred dollars ($200). ( )

More Than Two Sections. The permit fee for a home consisting of more than two (2) sections is two
hundred ﬁfty dollars ($250). (

04. In-Plant Inspection Agency Fees. In-plant inspection fees for manufactured homes produced by
Idaho Manufactures as per 39-4003A and 39-4004 of Idaho Code is set at forty-five dollars ($45) per floor.  ( )

0s. Inspections at Manufacturing Plants. The Division conducts inspections at the manufacturing
plant to determine compliance with codes adopted by Title 39, Chapters 40 and 41, Idaho Code, and Title 54,
Chapters 10, 26, and 50, Idaho Code. ( )

06. Manufactured Home Site Installation Inspections. Installation permits must be obtained from
the Division for installations in areas where there is no approved local program, or from a city or county that has by
ordinance adopted building codes pursuant to Section 39-4116, Idaho Code, and whose installation program has been
approved by the Division. All installations must be inspected and approved by the authority having jurisdiction
before the manufactured home is occupied. ( )

a. Installation inspections shall be conducted in accordance with the Idaho Manufactured Home
Installation Standard or the Design Approval Primary Inspection Agency of the manufactured home. ( )

07. Modular Site Installation Inspection. In order to complete the installation of an Idaho approved
Modular Building, approval and inspection of the installation by the enforcement agency having jurisdiction over the
site location is required. ( )

08. Qualifications of Inspectors. All inspectors must be properly certified for the type of inspection
being conducted. The Factory Built Structures Board recognizes certifications granted through the National
Certification Program Construction Code Inspector program (NCPCCI), the National Inspection Testing Certification
program (NITC), the International Association of Electrical Inspectors (IAEI), and the International Code Council

(ICC). «C )
09. Minimum Training Requirements for Inspectors. All manufactured home installation inspectors
must complete eight (8) hours of training or instruction germane to the profession. ( )
10. Rights and Limitations of Local Enforcement Agencies for Modular Buildings. ( )
a. A local enforcement agency has the right to require a complete set of plans and specifications

approved by the Division for each Modular Building to be installed within its jurisdiction, to require that all permits

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 437 September 6, 2023 — Vol. 23-9



DIVISION OF OCCUPATIONAL& PROFESSIONAL LICENSES Docket No. 24-3931-2301

Rules for Factory Built Structures ZBR Proposed (Fee) Rule
be obtained before delivery of any unit. ( )
b. A local enforcement agency does not have the right to: open for inspection any Modular Building

or component bearing an Insignia to determine compliance with any codes or ordinances; require by ordinance or
otherwise that Modular Buildings meet any requirements not equally applicable to on-site construction; or to charge
permit or plan review fees for any portion of the structure prefabricated or assembled at a place other than the
Building Site. ( )

11. Division Approval. A city or county that has by ordinance adopted a building code pursuant to
Section 39-4116, Idaho Code, is eligible to participate in the inspection of manufactured and mobile homes. Such
local installation inspection program must be approved by the Division to provide inspection services if the following

minimum criteria is met: ( )
a. Inspections are conducted by the city or county employing inspectors holding a valid certification
as residential building inspector from the International Code Council; ( )
b. Inspectors attended training sessions provided or approved by the Division and receive a certificate
evidencing successful completion thereof. ( )
c. Voluntary Withdrawal. A city or county may voluntarily withdraw from participation in the
program to inspect manufactured homes upon providing to the Administrator of the Division thirty (30) days written
notice of its intention to do so. ( )
d. Quality Assurance. Any inspected installation is subject to quality assurance reviews by Division of
Occupational and Professional Licenses. Findings made by the Division pursuant to such reviews will be forwarded
to the inspection authority having jurisdiction. ( )
i. All inspectors and approved programs are subject to review. ( )
12. Modular Insignia and Serial Number. ( )
a. Assigned Insignia are not transferable and are void when not affixed as assigned. ( )
b. Each Modular Building must bear a legible identifying serial number. Each section of a multiple
Modular Building must have the same identifying serial number followed by a numerical sequence identifier or a
letter suffix, or both. ( )

501. -- 999. (RESERVED)

[Agency redlined courtesy copy]
24.39.31 - RULES FOR FACTORY BUILT STRUCTURES

000. LEGAL AUTHORITY.
These rules are promulgated pursuant to Sections 39-4003, 39-4302, 44-2102, 44-2104, 44-2201, and 44-2202, Idaho
Code. ( )

001. SCOPE.

i These rules govern the manufacture and installation of modular
buildings in Idaho —Seetions—200—through—299—ef these—+ules apply to persons engaged in the business of
manufacturing, selling, or installing manufactured or mobile homes for purposes of human habitation in Idaho-,

apply to disputes between persons licensed as manufacturers, retailers, and
installers of manufactured homes:.—Seetions—400—through—499—ofthese—rules_and apply to the 1nsta11at10n of
manufactured or mobile homes in Idaho.( )

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 438 September 6, 2023 — Vol. 23-9



DIVISION OF OCCUPATIONAL& PROFESSIONAL LICENSES Docket No. 24-3931-2301
Rules for Factory Built Structures ZBR Proposed (Fee) Rule

002. INCORPORATION BY REFERENCE.
The Idaho Manufactured Home Installation Standard (January 1. 2018 edition), is hereby adopted and incorporated
by reference and is available on the DOPL website: https://dopl.idaho.gov.( )

002—009-(RESERVED)

01+603. DEFINITIONS.
The terms defined in this section have the following meaning, unless the context clearly indicates another meaning.

C )

01. Alterations to Manufactured Homes. The replacement, addition, and modification, or removal of
any equipment or installation after sale by a manufacturer to a retailer but prior to sale by a retailer to a purchaser
Wthh may affect the constructlon fire safety, occupancy, plumbmg, heat producmg or electrical system l-t—mel-uées

addition of an appliance requiring “plu-ln to an electrlcal receptacle Wthh apphance was not provided with the
manufactured home by the manufacturer, if the rating of the appliance does not exceed the rating of the receptacle to
which it is connected.( )

042. Deceptive Practice. Intentionally publishing or circulating any advertising concerning mobile or
manufactured homes which:( )

a. Is misleading or inaccurate in any material respect;( )
b. Misrepresents any of the products or services sold or provided by a manufacturer, manufactured/
mobile home retailer, or installation company.( )

053. Insignia. A label or tag issued by the Division to indicate compliance with the codes, standards,

rules, and regulations established for Modular Buildings and Commercial Coaches.( )
0634 . Installation. Fhe-term-inecludes—setapand-istThe complete operation of fixing in place a modular
building or manufactured or mobile home for occupancy.( )

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 439 September 6, 2023 — Vol. 23-9



DIVISION OF OCCUPATIONAL& PROFESSIONAL LICENSES Docket No. 24-3931-2301
Rules for Factory Built Structures ZBR Proposed (Fee) Rule

165. Principal Place of Business. The primary physical location at which the business of a
manufactured home retailer is lawfully conducted. Each of the following requirements must be met to qualify as the
principal place of business:( )

a. The business of the manufactured or mobile home retailer is lawfully conducted here;( )

b. The office or offices of the retailer is or are located here;( )

c. The public may contact the retailer here;( )

d. The offices are accessible and open to the public; and( )

e. The greatest portion of the retailer’s business is conducted here. The books and other records of a

retailer must be kept and maintained at the retailer’s principal place of business and be open to inspection during
normal business hours by any authorized agent of the Division. Moreover, there must be displayed on the exterior a
sign permanently affixed to the land or building with letters providing the business name of the retailer clearly visible
to the major avenue of traffic.( )

126. Used Manufactured Home or Mobile Home. A manufactured home or mobile home,
respectively, which has been:( )

a. Sold, rented, or leased and occupied prior to or after the sale, rental, or lease; or( )

b. Registered with or been the subject of a certificate of title issued by the Idaho Department of
Transportation or the appropriate authority of any state, the District of Columbia, or foreign state or country.( )

HH—099RESERVED)

SEHRCHAPT R A O PHARBUEH-RINGS
Erates -00-thegushl003

1500. PERMITS, PLAN REVIEWS., AND INSPECTIONS.

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 440 September 6, 2023 — Vol. 23-9



DIVISION OF OCCUPATIONAL& PROFESSIONAL LICENSES Docket No. 24-3931-2301

Rules for Factory Built Structures ZBR Proposed (Fee) Rule
The-folewing-fees-apply-te-the funetions-eited:( )
01. Modular Building Permit Fees. Permits must be obtained from the Division prior to the

construction of structures governed by 39-4303. Idaho Code. Other than as herein-specified in this section, the permit
fee schedule for Modular Buildings is as provided hereir-in Table 1-A plus ninety dollars ($90) and two and one-half
percent (2.5%) of the plumbing, electrical, and HVAC installation costs. The determination of value or valuation is
based on the total value of all construction work for which a permit is issued.

TABLE 1-A — MODULAR BUILDING PERMIT FEES

TOTAL VALUATION FEE
$1 to $500 = $23.50

$23.50 for the first $500 plus $3.05 for each additional
$100, or fraction thereof, to and including $2,000

$69.25 for the first $2,000 plus $14 for each additional
$1,000, or fraction thereof, to and including $25,000

$391.75 for the first $25,000 plus $10.10 for each additional
$1,000, or fraction thereof, to and including $50,000
$643.75 for the first $50,000 plus $7 for each additional
$1,000, or fraction thereof, to and including $100,000

$993.75 for the first $100,000 plus $5.60 for each additional
$1,000, or fraction thereof, to and including $500,000

$3,233.75 for the first $500,000 plus $4.75 for each additional
$1,000, or fraction thereof, to and including $1,000,000

$5,608.75 for the first $1,000,000 plus $3.65 for
each additional $1,000, or fraction thereof

$501 to $2,000 =

$2,001 to $25,000

$25,001 to $50,000

$50,001 to $100,000

$100,001 to $500,000

$500,001 to $1,000,000

$1,000,001and up

C )

02. Modular Plan Review. The Modular Building fee includes an additional amount equal to sixty-
five percent (65%) of the permit fee calculated in accordance with Table 1-A. A fee of sixty-five dollars ($65) per
hour applies to additional plan review required by changes, additions, or revisions to plans.( )

03. Manufactured/Mobile Home Installation Permit Fees. Permits must be obtained from the
Division prior to the site installation governed by 44-2202. and 39-4004, Idaho Code in accordance with the
following schedule:

a. Single Section Unit. The permit fee is one hundred fifty dollars ($150).( )
b. Double Section Unit. The permit fee is two hundred dollars ($200).( )
C. More Than Two Sections. The permit fee for a home consisting of more than two (2) sections is

two hundred fifty dollars ($250).( )

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 441 September 6, 2023 — Vol. 23-9



DIVISION OF OCCUPATIONAL& PROFESSIONAL LICENSES Docket No. 24-3931-2301
Rules for Factory Built Structures ZBR Proposed (Fee) Rule

04. In-Plant Inspection Agency Fees. In-plant inspection fees for manufactured homes produced by
Idaho Manufactures as per 39-4003A and 39-4004 of Idaho Code is set at forty-five dollars ($45) per floor.

a05+. Inspections at Manufacturing Plants. The Division conducts inspections at the manufacturing
plant to determine compliance with Seetions100-threugh199-of theserules—andswith-codes adopted by Title 39,
Chapters 40 and 41, Idaho Code, and Title 54, Chapters 10, 26, and 50, Idaho Code.( )

062. Manufactured Home Site Installation Inspections. Installation permits must be obtained from
the Division for installations in areas where there is no approved local program, or from a city or county that has by
ordinance adopted building codes pursuant to Section 39-4116. Idaho Code, and whose installation program has been
approved by the Division. All installations must be inspected and approved by the authority having jurisdiction
before the manufactured home is occupied.( )

a. Installation inspections shall be conducted in accordance with the Idaho Manufactured Home
Installation Standard or the Design Approval Primary Inspection Agency of the manufactured home.

07. Modular Site Installation Inspection. In order to complete the installation of an Idaho approved
Modular Building, approval and inspection of the installation by the enforcement agency having jurisdiction over the
site location is required.

b084. Qualifications of Inspectors. All inspectors performing-inspeections-ef-modularbuildings must be

properly certified for the type of inspection being conducted. The Factory Built Structures Board recognizes

certifications granted through the National Certification Program Construction Code Inspector program (NCPCCI),

the National Inspection Testing Certification program (NITC), the International Association of Electrical Inspectors
(IAEI), and the International Code Council (ICC).
)

095. Minimum Training Requirements for Inspectors. All manufactured home installation inspectors
must complete eight (8) hours of training or instruction germane to the profession. ( )

1046. Rights and Limitations of Local Enforcement Agencies_for Modular Buildings.( )

a. A local enforcement agency has the right to require a complete set of plans and specifications
approved by the Division for each Modular Building to be installed within its jurisdiction, to require that all permits
be obtained before delivery of any unit.( )

b. A local enforcement agency does not have the right to: open for inspection any Modular Building
or component bearing an Insignia to determine compliance with any codes or ordinances; require by ordinance or
otherwise that Modular Buildings meet any requirements not equally applicable to on-site construction; or to charge
permit or plan review fees for any portion of the structure prefabricated or assembled at a place other than the
Building Site.  ( )

1167. Division Approval. A city or county that has by ordinance adopted a building code pursuant to

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 442 September 6, 2023 — Vol. 23-9



DIVISION OF OCCUPATIONAL& PROFESSIONAL LICENSES Docket No. 24-3931-2301
Rules for Factory Built Structures ZBR Proposed (Fee) Rule

Section 39-4116. Idaho Code, is eligible to participate in the inspection of manufactured and mobile homes. Such
local installation inspection program must be approved by the Division to provide inspection services if the following
minimum criteria is met:( )

a. Inspections are conducted by the city or county employing inspectors holding a valid certification
as residential building inspector from the International Code Council:( )

b. Inspectors attended training sessions provided or approved by the Division and receive a certificate
evidencing successful completion thereof.( )

C. Voluntary Withdrawal, A city or county may voluntarily withdraw from participation in the

program to inspect manufactured homes upon providing to the Administrator of the Division thirty (30) days written
notice of its intention to do so.( )

d. Quality Assurance. Any inspected installation is subject to quality assurance reviews by Division of
Occupational and Professional Licenses. Findings made by the Division pursuant to such reviews will be forwarded
to the inspection authority having jurisdiction. ( )

i All inspectors and approved programs are subject to review.( )

12085. Modular Insignia and Serial Number.( )

£ael-hty—Ass1gned In51gn1a are not transferable and are V01d when not afﬁxed as a551gned ( ) "

b. Each Modular Building must bear a legible identifying serial number. Each section of a multiple
Modular Building must have the same identifying serial number followed by a numerical sequence identifier or a
letter suffix, or both.( )

104303. MODUEAR-300. CIVIL PENALTIES.

01. Modular Civil Penalties. The following acts subject the violator to penalties of not more than two
hundred dollars ($200) for the first offense and not more than one thousand dollars ($1,000) for each offense
thereafter:( )

a.84+. Installation. Any person who transperts-a-medularbuildingte-er-installs a modular building on a

building site in this state without first receiving approval and securing to the structure insignia evidencing such
approval from the Division.( )

b.82. Modification. Any person who in any way modifies or alters a modular building prior to its initial
occupancy which has previously been approved by the Division without first having received approval to do so from
the Division. (

2400:  100. LICENSURE MANUFACTUREDMOBH-EHOME HEENSEREQUIRED-

01. Manufactured/Mobile Home Licensure

a. Minimum Age Requirement. No license will be issued to a person under eighteen (18) years of

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 443 September 6, 2023 — Vol. 23-9



DIVISION OF OCCUPATIONAL& PROFESSIONAL LICENSES Docket No. 24-3931-2301
Rules for Factory Built Structures ZBR Proposed (Fee) Rule

age at the time of license application.( )

b. 822: Designated License Holder. Any applicant for a license under
rutes-who is not a natural person must designate a natural person to be license holder and represent the corporation,
partnership, trust, society, club, association, or other organization for all licensing purposes under Seetions—200
through—}%—these rules 1nclud1ng, but not limited to, testing and education. No issued licenses are transferable.

C )

bi a. Any person designated-tunder-Subseetion—200-02-of-these—+ules-represents one (1) applicant only,

and must immediately notify the Division in writing if his working relationship with the applicant has been
terminated. The license will be issued in the name of the designated license holder with the name of the organization
he represents also noted on the l1cense The lrcense holder is cons1dered by the Division to be the licensee;evenifthe

)

iie The applicant an esten : e—rules—agrees by
acceptance of the designation that the des1gnated person acts as agent of the applrcant for all purposes under Title 44,
Chapters 21 and 22, Idaho Code, and all rules promulgated thereunder.( )

wer—leMofeoveHAny lrcense 1ssued toa manufactured/mobﬂe home reta1ler must be posted ina consp1cuous place
on the business premises of the employer for whom the holder of the license is licensed. The license of a
manufacturing facility or branch office must also be posted in a conspicuous place at the location licensed.( )

iv. 05. Heensefor Manufaeturers—To engage in business in the state of Idaho, each manufacturer must
be licensed by the Division.( )

v. 86.

i The Division requires as a condition of licensing any information it deems necessary for each
location where a manufactured/mobile home retailer maintains a branch office. Fhe-mere-tisting-ef-manufactured/
mobile-hemesfor sale-doesnoet-constitute-a-branch-offiee; but-tThe use of a mobile home park or a state sales office
by a licensee for the sale or offermg for sale of manufactured/mobﬂe homes does—constrtutes the maintenance of a
branch office.A § anagermay

b- Te-open-a-branch-effiee;aA retailer must: obtain a license from the Division to operate the branch
office. ( )

e Applicants for a manufacturer's, retailers, or installer's license must furnish: Any proof the Division

may deem necessary that the applicant is a manufacturer, retailer, or installer; any proof the Division may require that
the applicant has a principal place of business: In the case of a retailer in new manufactured homes, an instrument in
the form prescribed by the Division executed by or on behalf of the manufacturer certifying that the applicant is an
authorized franchise retailer for the make concerned: The fee and proof of the bond required by Section 44-2103,
Idaho Code: and Proof of passing the examination required by these rules, as applicable. ( )

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 444 September 6, 2023 — Vol. 23-9



DIVISION OF OCCUPATIONAL& PROFESSIONAL LICENSES Docket No. 24-3931-2301
Rules for Factory Built Structures ZBR Proposed (Fee) Rule

vii. b= Within thirty (30) days after receipt of a completed application, the Division will issue or deny the
license.

viii. e. Each llcense is Vahd for a perlod of one (l) year from the date of issuance-and-may-be-renewed-for
seetitive ()

216+  PROOFOFEBUCAHONREQURED-

02+. Proof of Education Required.

a. Satisfactory Proof for Initial Application Submission. An application for a license as a
manufactured/mobile home installer must include proof satisfactory to the Division that the applicant has completed
the following number of hours of initial education in order to be approved:( )

is. Installers and retailers who are installers: eight (8) hours.( )

iib. The course of initial education must be approved by the Division and must include information
relating to the provisions of Seetiens200-threugh299-ef-these rules, Title 44, Chapters 21, Idaho Code, and the
National Manufactured Housing Construction and Safety Standards Act of 1974.( )

02 SAHSFACTORYPROOKFFORHEENSERENEWAL-

b. Satisfactory Proof for License Renewal. The Division will not renew any installer license, or
retailer license of any retailer who is also an installer, issued pursuant to Title 44, Chapters 21 or 22, Idaho Code, or
these rules until the licensee has submitted proof satlsfactory to the Division that he has
during the three (3) years immediately preceding the renewal of the license, completed at least eight (8) hours of
continuing education.( )

03a:i. ContinuingEdueation—Course—The course of continuing education must be approved by the

Division and include information_germane to the profession. relating-to-the-foHowing:——

24032. Examination Of Applicant For License.

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 445 September 6, 2023 — Vol. 23-9



DIVISION OF OCCUPATIONAL& PROFESSIONAL LICENSES Docket No. 24-3931-2301
Rules for Factory Built Structures ZBR Proposed (Fee) Rule

a.8+. Required Examinations. The Division requires a written examination of each applicant for an

1n1t1a1 l1cense asa manufactured/moblle home retaller or 1nsta11er4e—a¥e&d—the+eq-bufefﬁeﬂkef—a&e*amm&&en—&nd—be
; - ()

b (-)2 Appfewrl—e-f—Exammatlon and Grade E*&mn&&ens—fer—&ﬂ—ek&ssrﬁe&ﬁens—emde%ee&ens—%@@
h e i h . No license will be issued unless thean

apphcant receives a ﬁnal grade of seventy percent (70%) or hlgher( )

2033002.DISCIPLINARY ACTION AGAINST LICENSEES, CIVIL PENALTIES. AND CONSUMER
COMPLAINT AND DISPUT RESOLUTION.

01. The Division may deny, suspend, refuse to renew, or revoke any license issued-under—Fitle—44;
5 or reissue the license subject to reasonable
conditions upon any of the following grounds:( )

06.2.  Failure to Provide Business Name. Failure to include in any advertising the name of the licensed
retailer or installer.( )

07 Crreptraea

08b. Poor Workmanship. Performing workmanship which is grossly incompetent or repeatedly below
the standards adopted by Title 44, Chapters 21 and 22, Seetions200-through299-0r-400-threugh499-ef-the provisions
of these rules or the Natlonal Manufactured Housmg Constructlon and Safety Standards Act of 1974—er—the—l—atest

c48.  Failure to Honor Warranties. Failure to honor any warranty or other guarantee given by a
licensee for construction, workmanship, or material as a condition of securing a contract, or of selling, leasing,
reconstructing, improving, repairing, or installing any manufactured/mobile home.( )

d 2. Failure to Respond to Notice. Failure to respond to a notice served by the Division.( )

e13.  Failure to Permit Access to Documentary Materials. Failure or refusing to permit access by the
Division to relevant documentary materials after being requested to do so by the Division.( )

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 446 September 6, 2023 — Vol. 23-9



DIVISION OF OCCUPATIONAL& PROFESSIONAL LICENSES Docket No. 24-3931-2301
Rules for Factory Built Structures ZBR Proposed (Fee) Rule

fH4. Conviction of Misdemeanor. Conviction of a misdemeanor for violation of any of the provisions
of Title 44, Chapters 21 or 22, Idaho Code.( )

g35:  Conviction of Felony. Conviction or withheld judgment for a felony in this state, any U.S.
territory, or country.( )

h1%  Violation of Permit or Inspection Requirements. To knowingly violate any permit or inspection
requirements of any city or county of this state.( )

206400. MANUFACTURED/MOBILE HOME LICENSE FEES.

01. Fees for Issuance and Renewal of License. The following fees for the issuance and renewal of a
license will be charged:( )

a. Manufactured/mobile home retailer license: four hundred forty dollars ($440). Retailers who are
also installers will have to pay an installer's license fee to hold both licenses.( )

b. Manufacturer license: four hundred forty dollars ($440);( )

c. Manufactured/mobile home installer license: two hundred twenty dollars ($220);( )

02. Performance Bonding Requirements. Application for licensing will be accepted when

accompanied by the performance bond required by Section 44-2103, Idaho Code.( )

026+. FypeManufactured Home Civil Penalties. Except as otherwise provided, the following acts
subject the violator to penalties of not more than five hundred dollars ($500) for the first offense and not more than
one thousand dollars ($1,000) for each offense thereafter:( )

a. Industry Licensing. Except as provided for by Section 44-2106, Idaho Code, any person who
engages in the business of a manufacturer, retailer, or installer, as defined in Section 44-2101A, Idaho Code, without
being duly licensed by the Division.( )

b. Deceptive Practice. Any retailer or installer who intentionally publishes or circulates any
advertising that is misleading or inaccurate in any material respect or that misrepresents any of the products or
services sold or provided by a manufacturer, retailer, or installer.( )

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 447 September 6, 2023 — Vol. 23-9



DIVISION OF OCCUPATIONAL& PROFESSIONAL LICENSES Docket No. 24-3931-2301
Rules for Factory Built Structures ZBR Proposed (Fee) Rule

c. Dealing with Stolen Manufactured or Mobile Homes. Any person who knowingly purchases,
sells, or otherwise acquires or disposes of a stolen manufactured or mobile home is subject to a civil penalty of not
more than one thousand dollars ($1,000).( )

d. Failure to Maintain a Principal Place of Business. Any person who is a retailer duly licensed by
the Division and who fails to maintain a principal place of business within Idaho.( )
e. Violation of Rules and Statutes. Any person who knowingly violates Seetions200-threugh299-or

400-threugh-499-ef-these rules or Title 44, Chapters 21 or 22, Idaho Code.( )

02f. Gross Violation. In case of continued, repeated, or gross violations of
these rules, a license revocation may be initiated for licensed individuals under Title 44, Chapter
21, Idaho Code. Non-licensed individuals are subject to prosecution by the appropriate jurisdiction under Idaho law.(

)
209299 (RESERVED)

SEBCHAPTER- E—MANHACTERED- HOMES—
CONSUMER-COMPEAINTS—DISPUTERESOEUHON

Priles300-hepueh399
03. Consumer Complaints and Dispute Resolution NNVESTHGATION.

a. 0. Site Inspection. The Division may perform a site inspection, based on the nature of a complaint or
upon request of the complainant in accordance with HUD.( )

b.82. Fees. A charge for mileage to and from the inspection site, plus an hourly charge for the time spent
conducting the inspection, is assessed the manufacturer, installer, or retailer if a site inspection is made upon a request
by the manufacturer, installer, or retailer, and does not involve a serious defect or imminent safety hazard.

« )

c.83. Inspection Report. Following a site inspection, the inspector will prepare a final report and
include photographs.( )

30+, ACHOMN

d. Action. A notification letter and copies of the complaint form and investigation findings may be
provided to all involved parties and HUD.( )

04i. DivisienAetion—Any Division action, notification and follow-up are completed according to HUD
guidelines. ( )

02-ii. HieenseJile—If the nature of the complaint pertains to retailer contractual issues or installation
problems, a copy of the complaint is to be consolidated with the appropriate Division license files.( )

03:iii  Cerreetion-erRepair-A Division building inspector will issue a report concerning correction or
repair of defects that are a matter of dispute between the homeowner, retailer, installer, or manufacturer. The report
will include the likely cause of the defect and identify the party responsible for creating the defect that is in need of
correction or repair.( )

202  PRECEONS—APRIALS— N R A RIS POSHEN:

OHe. Decisions. The Administrator will review the inspector’s report and set forth the required
corrective action and identify the party responsible for such action. The Administrator may initiate a contested case
proceeding if, in his sole discretion, he determines that such a proceeding or further investigation would be of
assistance in reaching a decision. The decision must direct the responsible party to complete the required corrective

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 448 September 6, 2023 — Vol. 23-9



DIVISION OF OCCUPATIONAL& PROFESSIONAL LICENSES Docket No. 24-3931-2301
Rules for Factory Built Structures ZBR Proposed (Fee) Rule

action within specified timelines and consider the needs of the involved parties including, but not limited to, safety,
anticipated expense and availability of funds, time of year, and convenience to the parties.( )

92f: Appeals. Decisions of the administrator are final orders for purposes of appeal.( )

03¢ Informal Disposition -- Arbitration -- Mediation. Unless otherwise prohibited by other
provisions of law, informal disposition may be made of any complaint by negotiation, stipulation, agreed settlement,
and consent order. The parties may agree to enter into binding arbitration or mediation. Informal settlement of matters
is to be encouraged.( )

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 449 September 6, 2023 — Vol. 23-9



DIVISION OF OCCUPATIONAL& PROFESSIONAL LICENSES Docket No. 24-3931-2301
Rules for Factory Built Structures ZBR Proposed (Fee) Rule

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 450 September 6, 2023 — Vol. 23-9



PROPOSED RULE COST/BENEFIT ANALYSIS

Section 67-5223(3), Idaho Code, requires the preparation of an economic impact statement for all proposed rules
imposing or increasing fees or charges. This cost/benefit analysis, which must be filed with the proposed rule, must
include the reasonably estimated costs to the agency to implement the rule and the reasonably estimated costs to be
borne by citizens, or the private sector, or both.

Department or Agency: Division of Occupational and Professional Licenses

Agency Contact: Michael Hyde Phone: (208) 332-7133

Date: 8/3/2023

IDAPA, Chapter and Title Number and Chapter Name:

24.39.31 — Rules for Factory Built Structures

Fee Rule Status: X Proposed Temporary
Rulemaking Docket Number: 24-3931-2301
STATEMENT OF ECONOMIC IMPACT: This rulemaking does not impose a new fee or charge, or increase

a fee or charge, beyond what was previously submitted to and reviewed by the Idaho Legislature in the prior
rules.

The following is a specific description of the fees or charges:

01. Modular Building Permit Fees

TABLE 1-A - MODULAR BUILDING PERMIT FEES

TOTAL VALUATION FEE

$1 to $500 = $23.50

$23.50 for the first $500 plus $3.05 for each additional

$501 to $2,000 = $100, or fraction thereof, to and including $2,000

$69.25 for the first $2,000 plus $14 for each additional

$2,001 to $25,000 - $1,000, or fraction thereof, to and including $25,000

$391.75 for the first $25,000 plus $10.10 for each additional

$25,001 to $50,000 - $1,000, or fraction thereof, to and including $50,000

$643.75 for the first $50,000 plus $7 for each additional

$50,001 to $100,000 - $1,000, or fraction thereof, to and including $100,000

$993.75 for the first $100,000 plus $5.60 for each additional

$100,001 to $500,000 | = $1,000, or fraction thereof, to and including $500,000

Page 1 of 1



$3,233.75 for the first $500,000 plus $4.75 for each additional

$500,001 to $1,000,000 $1,000, or fraction thereof, to and including $1,000,000

$5,608.75 for the first $1,000,000 plus $3.65 for

$1,000,001and up each additional $1,000, or fraction thereof

02. Modular Plan Review

The Modular Building fee includes an additional amount equal to sixty-five percent (65%) of the permit fee calculated in
accordance with Table 1-A. A fee of sixty-five dollars ($65) per hour applies to additional plan review required by changes, additions,
or revisions to plans.

03. Manufactured/Mobile Home Installation Permit Fees. Permits obtained from the Division are in accordance with
the following schedule:

a. Single Section Unit. The permit fee is one hundred fifty dollars ($150).

b. Double Section Unit. The permit fee is two hundred dollars ($200).

c. More Than Two Sections. The permit fee for a home consisting of more than two (2) sections is two hundred fifty
dollars ($250).

04. In-Plant Inspection Agency Fees. In-plant inspection fees for manufactured homes produced by Idaho Manufactures

as per 39-4003 A and 39-4004 of Idaho Code is set at forty-five dollars ($45) per floor.

Page 2 of 2



INCORPORATION BY REFERENCE SYNOPSIS

In compliance with Section 67-5223(4), Idaho Code, the following is a synopsis of the differences
between the materials previously incorporated by reference in this rule that are currently of full
force and effect and newly revised or amended versions of these same materials that are being
proposed for incorporation by reference under this rulemaking.

The following agency of the state of Idaho has prepared this synopsis as part of the proposed
rulemaking for the chapter cited here under the docket number specified:

IDAPA 24 — Division of Occupational and Professional Licenses

24.39.31 — Rules for Factory Built Structures

Proposed Rulemaking - Docket No. 24-3931-2301

The proposed rulemaking adopts and incorporates the current version of the Idaho Manufactured
Home Installation Standard (January 1, 2018 edition). The current rules incorporate the same
code.



IDAPA 24 — DIVISION OF OCCUPATIONAL AND PROFESSIONAL LICENSES
24.39.50 — RULES OF THE PUBLIC WORKS CONTRACTORS LICENSE BOARD
DOCKET NO. 24-3950-2301 (ZBR CHAPTER REWRITE, FEE RULE)

NOTICE OF RULEMAKING - PROPOSED RULE

AUTHORITY: In compliance with Section 67-5221(1), Idaho Code, notice is hereby given that this agency has
initiated proposed rulemaking procedures. This rulemaking action is authorized pursuant to Section 67-2604, Idaho
Code, and Sections 54-1907, 67-2614, 67-9406, and 67-9409, Idaho Code.

PUBLIC HEARING SCHEDULE: The public hearing concerning this rulemaking will be held as follows:

Monday, September 11, 2023, 9:00 a.m. MT

Division of Occupational and Professional Licenses
Chinden Campus Building 4
11341 W. Chinden Blvd., Bldg. #4
Boise, ID 83714

Telephone and web conferencing information will be posted on:
https://dopl.idaho.gov/calendar/ and https://townhall.idaho.gov/

The hearing site will be accessible to persons with disabilities, if needed. Requests for accommodation must be
made not later than five (5) days prior to the meeting to the agency address below.

DESCRIPTIVE SUMMARY AND STATEMENT OF PURPOSE: The following is a nontechnical explanation of
the substance and purpose of the proposed rulemaking:

Under Executive Order 2020-01, Zero-Based Regulation, the Public Works Contractors License Board is striving
to prevent the accumulation of costly, ineffective, and outdated regulations and reduce regulatory burden to achieve a
more efficient operation of government. In conjunction with stakeholders, the proposed rule changes reflect a
comprehensive review of this chapter by collaborating with the public to streamline or simplify the rule language in
this chapter and to use plain language for better understanding. This proposed rulemaking updates the rules to comply
with governing statute and Executive Order 2020-01.

FEE SUMMARY: The following is a specific description of the fee or charge imposed or increased:

The fees for applications, licenses, and reinstatement as designated in Rule 400 of these proposed rules are
authorized in Section 54-1907, Idaho Code. None of these fees are being changed as a result of this rulemaking or
since being previously reviewed by the Idaho legislature.

FISCAL IMPACT: The following is a specific description, if applicable, of any negative fiscal impact on the state
general fund greater than ten thousand dollars ($10,000) during the fiscal year as a result of this rulemaking:

This rulemaking is not anticipated to have any negative fiscal impact on the State General Fund.
NEGOTIATED RULEMAKING: Pursuant to Section 67-5220, Idaho Code, negotiated rulemaking was conducted
under Docket No. 24-ZBRR-2301. The Notice of Intent to Promulgate Rules - Negotiated Rulemaking was published
in the June, 7 2023 Idaho Administrative Bulletin, Vol. 23-6, pp. 75-76.

INCORPORATION BY REFERENCE: Pursuant to Section 67-5229(2)(a), Idaho Code, the following is a brief
synopsis of why the materials cited are being incorporated by reference into this rule: N/A.

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 451 September 6, 2023 — Vol. 23-9


https://gov.idaho.gov/wp-content/uploads/2020/01/eo-2020-01.pdf
https://adminrules.idaho.gov/bulletin/2023/06.pdf#page=75
https://dopl.idaho.gov/calendar/
https://townhall.idaho.gov/

DIVISION OF OCCUPATIONAL& PROFESSIONAL LICENSES Docket No. 24-3950-2301
Rules of the Public Works Contractors License Board ZBR Proposed (Fee) Rule

ASSISTANCE ON TECHNICAL QUESTIONS, SUBMISSION OF WRITTEN COMMENTS, OBTAINING
DRAFT COPIES: For assistance on technical questions concerning this proposed rule, contact Katie Stuart,
Administration Bureau Chief, at (208) 577-2489. Materials pertaining to the proposed rulemaking, including any
available preliminary rule drafts, can be found on the following DOPL website: https://dopl.idaho.gov/rulemaking/.

Anyone may submit written comments regarding this proposed rulemaking. All written comments must be
directed to the undersigned and must be delivered on or before September 27, 2023.

DATED this 8th day of August, 2023.

Katie Stuart

Bureau Chief

11341 W. Chinden Blvd., Bldg. #4
Boise, ID 83714

Phone: (208) 577-2489

Email: katie.stuart@dopl.idaho.gov
Website: https://dopl.idaho.gov/

THE FOLLOWING IS THE PROPOSED TEXT OF FEE DOCKET NO. 24-3950-2301
(ZBR Chapter Rewrite)

*Note — Due to extensive reorganization of this ZBR chapter, the rule text below is presented as clean text without showing
amendments in legislative format. A redline copy provided by the agency has been included at the end of the docket for transparency
and can be utilized to track all edits used to formulate the proposed rule.

24.39.50 - RULES OF THE PUBLIC WORKS CONTRACTORS LICENSE BOARD

000. LEGAL AUTHORITY.
This chapter is adopted pursuant to Sections 54-1907, 67-2604, 67-2614, 67-9409, and 67-9406 Idaho Code, as
amended. ( )

001. TITLE.
These rules govern the practice of public works contractors in Idaho. ( )

002. -- 009. (RESERVED)
010. DEFINITIONS.

01. Compiled. A type of financial statement in which the information presented is based solely upon
representations by an organization’s management. ( )
02. Estimated Cost. The total aggregate amount of the value of all the separate or individual jobs,
parts, components, or undertakings involved in the construction of a single project when combined and considered as
a whole. ( )
03. Financial Statement. A balance sheet and income statement prepared in accordance with generally
accepted accounting principles. ( )

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 452 September 6, 2023 — Vol. 23-9


https://dopl.idaho.gov/rulemaking/
https://dopl.idaho.gov/
mailto: katie.stuart@dopl.idaho.gov

DIVISION OF OCCUPATIONAL& PROFESSIONAL LICENSES Docket No. 24-3950-2301
Rules of the Public Works Contractors License Board ZBR Proposed (Fee) Rule

04. Incidental Work. Work, the nature of which does not require any additional trade licenses and
which may be carried out in conjunction with an activity for which the licensee is licensed, but is not intended to
produce an amount of income over ten percent (10%) of the total bid amount. ( )

05. Independent Audit Report. A report prepared by an independent certified public accountant
presenting opinion on the fairness of the organization’s financial statements and prepared in accordance with
generally accepted auditing standards. ( )

06. Qualified Individual. The person qualifying by examination as to the experience and knowledge
required by Section 54-1910(a), Idaho Code. ( )

07. Reviewed. A financial statement that is accompanied by the opinion of a certified public
accountant stating that, based upon representations by the organization’s management, the reviewer has a reasonable
basis for expressing limited assurance that there are no material modifications that should be made to the financial
statements in order for the statements to be in accordance with generally accepted accounting principles. ( )
011. -- 099. (RESERVED)

100. LICENSURE.

01. Renewal. ( )
a. Filing Deadline. Applications for renewal of a license must be filed by the last working day of the
month in which the license expires. ( )
b. Extension of Time. A petition for an extension of time in which to renew must be filed by the last
working day of the month in which the license expires and may be extended once for a period not to exceed sixty (60)
days. Approval of a petition for extension of time authorizes operation as a contractor. ( )
c. Failure to File. If the licensee fails to file a timely application for renewal or petition for extension,

the license lapses and expires on the last day of the license period. Licenses not renewed in a timely manner are
considered delinquent for a period of one (1) year from the last day of the license period and may be renewed at any
time during that year. ( )

d. Expedited Licensure. Upon an applicant’s request and payment of a fee of one hundred dollars
($100), the Division will expedite its review and determination of a license application. ( )

02. Petition to change or add types of construction. A petition to change or add types of construction
must be supported by evidence, satisfactory to the administrator, of work history, job performance, experience,
equipment, and financial responsibility. ( )

03. Application. The applicant must submit to the administrator, on such forms and in a format as the
administrator prescribes. ( )

a. For Class A, AA, AAA, and Unlimited license applications, financial statements must be
accompanied by an independent auditor’s report, or be reviewed. For Class B and CC license applications, financial
statements must be accompanied by an independent audit report or be reviewed or compiled by a certified public
accountant. For Class C and Class D license applications, financial statements must be accompanied by an
independent audit report or be reviewed, compiled, or on the form provided by the administrator. ( )

b. Applicants requesting a higher licensing class must provide documentation of having performed
projects similar in scope and character to those for which license is requested. Licenses granted under this rule are
valid for twelve (12) months from the date of issuance. ( )

c. Extension of Time to File Financial Statement. The administrator may grant an extension of time to
file the annual financial statement if the licensee provides an interim compiled balance sheet and income statement
for the applicant’s fiscal year-to-date. A renewal application must be filed prior to the first day of the licensing period,

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 453 September 6, 2023 — Vol. 23-9



DIVISION OF OCCUPATIONAL& PROFESSIONAL LICENSES
Rules of the Public Works Contractors License Board

Docket No. 24-3950-2301
ZBR Proposed (Fee) Rule

and is valid for a period of twelve (12) months from the date of the issuance. ( )
d. Financial Requirements:
LICENSE CLASS NET WORTH WORKING CAPITAL
Unlimited $2,000,000 $2,000,000
AAA $1,200,000 $400,000
AA $900,000 $300,000
A $600,000 $200,000
B $300,000 $100,000
CcC $150,000 $50,000
C $50,000 $15,000
D $20,000 $6,000
«C )
04. Examination. The Board approves all subject areas and topics to be included in the public works
contractor license examination. Applicants for licensure must pass an examination as approved by the Board. ( )
a. Professional Testing Services. The administrator may contract with a professional testing service to
administer the examination. ( )
b. Individual Qualified By Examination. Written notice that the Qualified Individual of a public
works contractor has ceased to be connected with the contractor must be provided to the Administrator. ( )
0s. Limitations. ( )
a. One License. A licensee will be permitted to hold only one (1) class of license at any given time.
)
b. Previous License Null and Void. When a licensee of one class has been issued a license of another
class, the previous license is null and void. ( )
c. Total Bid Cost. The total of any single bid on a given public works project, or the aggregate total of

any split bids, or the aggregate total of any base bid and any alternate bid items, or the aggregate total of any separate
bid by a licensee of any class, except Class Unlimited, may not exceed the estimated cost or bid limit of the class of
license held by the licensee. The aggregate total of bids must include all bids of the subcontractors. Subcontractor

bids are not considered a separate bid for the purposes of computing the bid on a given public works project. ( )

d. Two or More Licensees. Two (2) or more licensees of the same class or of different classes are not
permitted to combine the estimated cost or bid limit of their licenses to submit a bid in excess of the license held by
either licensee. ( )

06. Construction Manager Examinations. ( )

a. If the applicant fails an examination, the applicant may take the examination a second time. If the
applicant fails to achieve a passing grade , the applicant must wait for a period set by the Administrator before taking
the examination again. The applicant must then take and pass all sections of the examination. ( )
101. -- 199. (RESERVED)

200. PRACTICE STANDARDS.

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 454 September 6, 2023 — Vol. 23-9



DIVISION OF OCCUPATIONAL& PROFESSIONAL LICENSES Docket No. 24-3950-2301
Rules of the Public Works Contractors License Board ZBR Proposed (Fee) Rule

01. Business Organization -- Changes In Organization Or Structure -- Members Of Joint
Ventures - Changes For Reasons Other Than Death. A licensed public works contractor or construction manager
who undergoes a change in business organization or structure (such as a change from an individual proprietor to a
partnership, corporation, limited liability partnership, limited liability company, joint venture, or other combination
thereof), or where there is a change in ownership, must file an application for a new license on behalf of such
successor organization or new owners within sixty (60) days after such change occurs. The administrator may
authorize the continuous operation of the licensee as a contractor during the interim period until the application of the
successor organization is reviewed; provided written notice of such change is filed within thirty (30) days after such
change occurs. Each participant in a joint venture must be licensed at the time of bidding. Where there is a change in
the surviving members of a licensed partnership, limited liability company, or limited liability partnership, due to a
reason other than the death of one (1) of the partners, the remaining or succeeding member or members are required

to file an application for an original license. ( )
02. License Number On Bids. Licensee must place his license number on any and all bids submitted
or contracts entered into, for any public works projects in the state of Idaho. ( )
03. Changes In License Certificate. ( )
a. When any change in the license certificate has been approved by the Board, a new license
certificate will be issued. ( )

201. -- 399. (RESERVED)
400.  FEES.

01. Public Works Contractor.

License Class Initial Fee Renewal Fee

Unlimited $550 $440

AAA $450 $360

AA $350 $280

A $250 $160

B $150 $120

cC $125 $100

C $100 $80

D $50 $40

«C )
02. Construction Manager:

License Activity Fee
Initial Licensing $200
License Renewall $200
Inactive License $50
License Reinstatement $200
Certificate of Authority $100

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 455 September 6, 2023 — Vol. 23-9



DIVISION OF OCCUPATIONAL& PROFESSIONAL LICENSES Docket No. 24-3950-2301
Rules of the Public Works Contractors License Board ZBR Proposed (Fee) Rule

C )

401. -- 999. (RESERVED)

[Agency redlined courtesy copy]

24.39.50 — RULES OF THE PUBLIC WORKS CONTRACTORS LICENSE BOARD

000. LEGAL AUTHORITY.
This chapter is adopted pursuant to Sections 54-1907, 67-2604, 67-2614, 67-9409, and 67-9406 Idaho Code, as
amended. ( )

001. TITLE.
These rules govern the practice of public works contractors in Idaho.( )

002—009-(RESERVED)

010. DEFINITIONS.
As-usedin these rules:( )

= )
012. Compiled. A type of financial statement in which the information presented is based solely upon
representations by an organization’s management.( )

023. Estimated Cost.-Ferth po i e
“estimated—eost>—refers—te Tthe total aggregate amount of the Value of all the separate or 1nd1v1dual _]ObS parts
components, or undertakrngs involved in the constructlon of a s1ngle prOJect when comblned and con51dered as a
whole., regard 3 cpes-efreades ol W

034. Financial Statement. A balance sheet and income statement prepared in accordance with generally
accepted accounting principles.( )

045. Incidental Work. Work, the nature of which does not require any additional trade licenses and
which may be carried out in conjunction with an activity for which the licensee is licensed, but is not intended to
produce an amount of income over ten percent (10%) of the total bid amount.( )

056. Independent Audit Report. A report prepared by an independent certified public accountant
presenting sueh—auditer’s—opinion on the fairness of the organization’s financial statements and prepared in
accordance with generally accepted auditing standards.( )

068. Qualified Individual. The person qualifying by examination as to the experience and knowledge
required by Section 54-1910(a), Idaho Code.( )

079-.  Reviewed. Refersto—a A financial statement that is accompanied by the opinion of a certified
public accountant stating that, based upon representations by the organization’s management, the reviewer has a
reasonable basis for expressing limited assurance that there are no material modifications that should be made to the
financial statements in order for the statements to be in accordance with generally accepted accounting principles.(

)

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 456 September 6, 2023 — Vol. 23-9



DIVISION OF OCCUPATIONAL& PROFESSIONAL LICENSES Docket No. 24-3950-2301
Rules of the Public Works Contractors License Board ZBR Proposed (Fee) Rule

01. Renewal

a. Filing Deadline. Applications for renewal of a license must be filed by the last working day of the
month in which the license expires.( )
02b. Extension of Time. A petition for an extension of time in which to renew must be filed by the last

working day of the month in which the license expires_ and may be extended once for a period not to exceed sixty (60)
davs Am)roval of a Detltlon for extensmn of tlme authorlzes oneratlon as a contractor . Thepetition—must-be

04:c.  Failure to File. If the licensee fails to file a timely application for renewal or petition for extension,
the license lapses and expires on the last day of the license period. Licenses not renewed in a timely manner are
considered delinquent for a perlod of one (1) year from the last day of the hcense perlod and may be renewed at any
time during that year. Hee A arbee 3 3

feHemsta%emeﬂt—mﬂst—&ppl—y—as—rﬁfer—a—ﬁe%heeﬂs&( )

05d. Expedited Licensure. Upon an applicant’s request and payment of a fee of one hundred dollars

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 457 September 6, 2023 — Vol. 23-9



DIVISION OF OCCUPATIONAL& PROFESSIONAL LICENSES Docket No. 24-3950-2301
Rules of the Public Works Contractors License Board ZBR Proposed (Fee) Rule

($100) the D1V1s1on w111 exped1te 1ts review and determlnatlon of a 11cense apphcatlon JEhe—fee—fer—t-his—sew}ee—rs

02. Petition to change or add types of construction. A petition to change or add types of
construction must be supported by evidence, satisfactory to the administrator, of work history, _]Ob performance,

experlence equlpment and ﬁnanc:1a1 respon51b111ty,

034+. Application-Peeumentation. To-obtatnatieense-Tthe applicant must submit to the administrator,
on such forms and ina format as the admlmstrator prescrlbes —me}udmg—e}ee&emeaﬁl—aeeemp&med—by—me—requed

B

ea. For Class A, AA, AAA, and Unlimited license applications, financial statements must be
accompanied by an independent auditor’s report, or be reviewed. For Class B and CC license applications, financial
statements must be accompanied by an independent audit report or be reviewed or compiled by a certified public

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 458 September 6, 2023 — Vol. 23-9



DIVISION OF OCCUPATIONAL& PROFESSIONAL LICENSES Docket No. 24-3950-2301
Rules of the Public Works Contractors License Board ZBR Proposed (Fee) Rule

accountant. For Class C and Class D license applications, financial statements must be accompanied by an
1ndependent audrt report or be rev1ewed comprled or on the form prov1ded by the admmlstrator—&nd—mel-ade—sueh

gb. Applicants requesting a higher licensing class
lieensed-must provide documentatlon—s&trsfaeteﬂhte—the—admﬁﬁstr&ter— of having performed projects; similar in scope
and character to those for which license is requested. Llcenses ;_ranted under this rule are valid for twelve ( 12)
months from the date of issuance. ary—valie with : :

03-c.  Extension of Time to File Financial Statement. The administrator may grant an extension of time
to file the annual financial statement if the hcensee prov1des an 1nter1m complled balance sheet and income statement
for the applrcant s ﬁscal year—to date uly as-tru 3 ARt : ’

efﬁeer—Sﬁeh—rA renewal applrcatron must be ﬁled pnor to the ﬁrst day of the sueh—renewal llcensmg perrod and —Ln

the-eventan-extension-is granted;-the renewallieense is valid for a period of twelve (12) months from the date of the
issuance.-of the-renewal-license( )

d Financial Requirements:

FARLEAM-04—FINANCIAL REQUIREMENTS
LICENSE CLASS NET WORTH WORKING CAPITAL
Unlimited $4,606;6002,000.000 $4,666,6002,000,000
AAA $606,6601,200,000 $206;600400,000

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 459 September 6, 2023 — Vol. 23-9



DIVISION OF OCCUPATIONAL& PROFESSIONAL LICENSES Docket No. 24-3950-2301

Rules of the Public Works Contractors License Board ZBR Proposed (Fee) Rule
AA $450,000900.000 $456,600300,000
A $300,000600.000 $4066;600200,000
B $450,000300.000 $56;060100,000
cC $75,806150,000 $25;60050,000
C $25,00050,000 $#506015,000
D $40,00020,000 $3:0006.000
«C )
04. Examination. The Board approves all subject areas and topics to be included in the public works
contractor license (exam;natlon Applicants for licensure must pass an examination as approved by the Board.

b: re—spahenrteetl-benotbedserttne
it-be-given—fotowi Fofd Heation( ;

62:a.  Professional Testing Services. In—teu—of—the—administration—by the—administrator—of—the
exammat}eﬁ—fer—heeﬂses—tThe admlmstrator may contract w1th a professmnal testlng service to admlmster the

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 460 September 6, 2023 — Vol. 23-9



DIVISION OF OCCUPATIONAL& PROFESSIONAL LICENSES Docket No. 24-3950-2301
Rules of the Public Works Contractors License Board ZBR Proposed (Fee) Rule

0b. WrittenNotiee: Individual Qualified By Examination. Written notice

—required-bySeetion—54-
1910¢a);1dahe-Code; that the Qualified Individual of a pubhc works contractor has ceased to be connected Wlth the
contractor must be provided to the Administrator.-es

0+05. Limitations

a. One License. A licensee will be permitted to hold only one (1) class of license at any given time.
«C )

02:b. Previous License Null and Void. When a licensee of one class has been issued a license of another
class, the previous license is null and void.( )

03-c.  Total Bid Cost. The total of any single bid on a given public works project, or the aggregate total
of any split bids, or the aggregate total of any base bid and any alternate bid items, or the aggregate total of any
separate bid by a licensee of any class, except Class Unlimited, may not exceed the estimated cost or bid limit of the
class of license held by the licensee. The aggregate total of bids must include all bids of the subcontractors.
Subcontractor bids are not considered a separate bid for the purposes of computing the bid on a given public works

project. ( )

04:d. Two or More Licensees. Two (2) or more licensees of the same class or of different classes are not
permitted to combine the estimated cost or bid limit of their licenses to submit a bid in excess of the license held by
either licensee.( )

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 461 September 6, 2023 — Vol. 23-9



DIVISION OF OCCUPATIONAL& PROFESSIONAL LICENSES Docket No. 24-3950-2301
Rules of the Public Works Contractors License Board ZBR Proposed (Fee) Rule

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 462 September 6, 2023 — Vol. 23-9



DIVISION OF OCCUPATIONAL& PROFESSIONAL LICENSES Docket No. 24-3950-2301
Rules of the Public Works Contractors License Board ZBR Proposed (Fee) Rule

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 463 September 6, 2023 — Vol. 23-9



DIVISION OF OCCUPATIONAL& PROFESSIONAL LICENSES Docket No. 24-3950-2301
Rules of the Public Works Contractors License Board ZBR Proposed (Fee) Rule

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 464 September 6, 2023 — Vol. 23-9



DIVISION OF OCCUPATIONAL& PROFESSIONAL LICENSES Docket No. 24-3950-2301
Rules of the Public Works Contractors License Board ZBR Proposed (Fee) Rule

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 465 September 6, 2023 — Vol. 23-9



DIVISION OF OCCUPATIONAL& PROFESSIONAL LICENSES Docket No. 24-3950-2301
Rules of the Public Works Contractors License Board ZBR Proposed (Fee) Rule

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 466 September 6, 2023 — Vol. 23-9



DIVISION OF OCCUPATIONAL& PROFESSIONAL LICENSES Docket No. 24-3950-2301
Rules of the Public Works Contractors License Board ZBR Proposed (Fee) Rule

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 467 September 6, 2023 — Vol. 23-9



DIVISION OF OCCUPATIONAL& PROFESSIONAL LICENSES Docket No. 24-3950-2301
Rules of the Public Works Contractors License Board ZBR Proposed (Fee) Rule

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 468 September 6, 2023 — Vol. 23-9



DIVISION OF OCCUPATIONAL& PROFESSIONAL LICENSES Docket No. 24-3950-2301
Rules of the Public Works Contractors License Board ZBR Proposed (Fee) Rule

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 469 September 6, 2023 — Vol. 23-9



DIVISION OF OCCUPATIONAL& PROFESSIONAL LICENSES Docket No. 24-3950-2301
Rules of the Public Works Contractors License Board ZBR Proposed (Fee) Rule

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 470 September 6, 2023 — Vol. 23-9



DIVISION OF OCCUPATIONAL& PROFESSIONAL LICENSES Docket No. 24-3950-2301
Rules of the Public Works Contractors License Board ZBR Proposed (Fee) Rule

{

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 471 September 6, 2023 — Vol. 23-9



DIVISION OF OCCUPATIONAL& PROFESSIONAL LICENSES Docket No. 24-3950-2301
Rules of the Public Works Contractors License Board ZBR Proposed (Fee) Rule

Public Works Contractpn i

TABLE 20404 —INITIAL AND RENEWAL LICENSING FEES
License Class Initial Fee Renewal Fee

Unlimited $550 $440

AAA $450 $360

AA $350 $280

A $250 $160

B $150 $120

cC $125 $100

$100 $80

D $50 $40

«C )
02. Construction Manager.—Heensing—Fees—Fees—for—econstruction—manager—lieenses—are;—in
' ' 5 5 )
TABLE 201.02 - CONSTRUCTION MANAGER LICENSING FEES
License Activity Fee
Initial Licensing $200
License Renewal $200
Inactive License $50
License Reinstatement $200
£ Adrmini . e blishedt .

Certificate of Authority $100

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 472 September 6, 2023 — Vol. 23-9



DIVISION OF OCCUPATIONAL& PROFESSIONAL LICENSES Docket No. 24-3950-2301
Rules of the Public Works Contractors License Board ZBR Proposed (Fee) Rule

203—299-RESERVED)
3046- 200. PRACTICE STANDARDS

01. BUSINESS ORGANIZATION -- CHANGES IN ORGANIZATION OR STRUCTURE --
MEMBERS OF JOINT VENTURES - CHANGES FOR REASONS OTHER THAN DEATH.
A licensed public works contractor or construction manager who undergoes a change in business organization or
structure (such as a change from an individual proprietor to a partnership, corporation, limited liability partnership,
limited liability company, joint venture, or other combination thereof), or where there is a change in ownership, must
file an application for a new license on behalf of such successor organization or new owners within sixty (60) days
after such change occurs. The administrator may authorize the continuous operation of the licensee as a contractor
during the interim period until the application of the successor organization is reviewed; provided written notice of
such change is filed within thirty (30) days after such change occurs. Each participant in a joint venture must be
licensed at the time of bidding. Where there is a change in the surviving members of a licensed partnership, limited
liability company, or limited liability partnership, due to a reason other than the death of one (1) of the partners, the
remaining or succeeding member or members are required to file an application for an original license.

« )

02. LICENSE NUMBER ON BIDS.
Licensee must place his license number on any and all bids submitted or contracts entered into, for any public works
projects in the state of Idaho.( )

02
03. CHANGES IN LICENSE CERTIFICATE.
a. When any change in the license certificate has been approved by the Board, a new license
certificate will be issued.
«C )

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 473 September 6, 2023 — Vol. 23-9



DIVISION OF OCCUPATIONAL& PROFESSIONAL LICENSES Docket No. 24-3950-2301
Rules of the Public Works Contractors License Board ZBR Proposed (Fee) Rule

06. CONSTRUCTION MANAGER EXAMINATIONS.

a. If the appllcant fa1ls an examlnatlon the apphcant may take the examlnatlon a second time. A

apphcant falls to achleve a passmg grade m—e&eh—md-méwﬂ—see&eﬂ—eﬁ—&}e—seeeﬂd—e*amm&&eﬁ the apphcant must
wait ene{(H-fallrear for a period set by the Administrator before taking the examination again. The applicant must

then take and pass all sections of the examination. (reeeivingne-ereditforsections-sueeessfully-completed-duringthe
previeus-year):( )

601—999 (RESERVED)

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 474 September 6, 2023 — Vol. 23-9



PROPOSED RULE COST/BENEFIT ANALYSIS

Section 67-5223(3), Idaho Code, requires the preparation of an economic impact statement for all proposed rules
imposing or increasing fees or charges. This cost/benefit analysis, which must be filed with the proposed rule, must
include the reasonably estimated costs to the agency to implement the rule and the reasonably estimated costs to be
borne by citizens, or the private sector, or both.

Department or Agency: Division of Occupational and Professional Licenses

Agency Contact: Michael Hyde Phone: (208) 332-7133

Date: 8/4/2023

IDAPA, Chapter and Title Number and Chapter Name:

24.39.50 — Rules of the Public Works Contractors License Board

Fee Rule Status: X Proposed Temporary
Rulemaking Docket Number: 24-3950-2301
STATEMENT OF ECONOMIC IMPACT: This rulemaking does not impose a new fee or charge, or increase

a fee or charge, beyond what was previously submitted to and reviewed by the Idaho Legislature in the prior
rules.

The following is a specific description of the fees or charges:

01. Public Works Contractor.

Ié‘l;es's‘se Initial Fee l;::ewal
Unlimited $550 $440
AAA $450 $360
AA $350 $280

A $250 $160

B $150 $120
cC $125 $100

C $100 $80

D $50 $40

Page 1 of 1



02. Construction Manager.

TABLE 201.02 - CONSTRUCTION MANAGER LICENSING FEES
License Activity Fee

Initial Licensing $200

License Renewal $200

Inactive License $50

License Reinstatement $200

Certificate of Authority $100

Page 2 of 2



	Docket No. 24-3930-2302 (ZBR Chapter Rewrite, Fee Rule)
	Docket No. 24-3931-2301 (ZBR Chapter Rewrite, Fee Rule)
	Docket No. 24-3950-2301 (ZBR Chapter Rewrite, Fee Rule)

